
Title 2—DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE
Division 70—Plant Industries

Chapter 10—Missouri Plant Law Rules

PROPOSED RULE

2 CSR 70-10.025 Nonprofit Nursery Dealer Defined

PURPOSE: This rule defines a nonprofit nursery dealer. 

(1) A nursery dealer registered with the state as a nonprofit organi-
zation overseeing membership entities which may offer nursery stock
for sale. The sale of such nursery stock is limited to not more than
two (2), one- (1-) day sales conducted in a certificate year (October
1 to September 30). Nonprofit nursery dealers and their membership
entities shall be subject to the provisions of sections 263.010 to
263.180, RSMo. Nonprofit nursery dealers shall submit notification
to the department for each membership entity sale at least thirty (30)

days prior to the sale. Notification shall include, but not be limited
to, the name, contact name, address, phone number, and sale date(s)
for the membership entity.

AUTHORITY: section 263.040, RSMo 2000. Original rule filed June
22, 2012.

PUBLIC COST: This proposed rule will not cost state agencies or
political subdivisions more than five hundred dollars ($500) in the
aggregate.

PRIVATE COST: This proposed rule will not cost private entities
more than five hundred dollars ($500) in the aggregate.

NOTICE TO SUBMIT COMMENTS: Anyone may file a statement in
support of or in opposition to this proposed rule with the Missouri
Department of Agriculture, PO Box 630, Jefferson City, MO 65102.
To be considered, comments must be received within thirty (30) days
after publication of this notice in the Missouri Register. No public
hearing is scheduled.

Title 2—DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE
Division 70—Plant Industries

Chapter 10—Missouri Plant Law Rules

PROPOSED AMENDMENT

2 CSR 70-10.075 Fee Schedule. The division is amending section
(10).

PURPOSE: This amendment establishes a fee schedule for nonprofit
nursery dealers.

(10) Nursery dealer registration-inspection certificates shall be fifty
dollars ($50) annually per outlet, and this fee is payable at the time
of making application. Restricted nursery dealer registration-inspec-
tion certificates shall be twenty-five dollars ($25) annually per out-
let, and this fee is payable at the time of making application.
Nonprofit nursery dealer registration-inspection certificates shall
be one hundred dollars ($100) annually per nonprofit organiza-
tion overseeing membership entities, and this fee is payable at the
time of making application. If the nursery dealer registration-
inspection certificate is not renewed prior to offering nursery stock
for sale, there shall be a penalty of fifty percent (50%) assessed and
added to the original fee and paid by the applicant before the regis-
tration-inspection certificate shall be issued. This penalty is to recov-
er the costs associated with reinspections. 

AUTHORITY: section 263.040, RSMo [1986] 2000. Original rule
filed Sept. 12, 1984, effective Jan. 1, 1985. Amended: Filed Dec. 2,
1991, effective April 9, 1992. Amended: Filed June 19, 2012.

PUBLIC COST: This proposed amendment will cost state agencies or
political subdivisions eight hundred seventy-five dollars ($875) in the
aggregate.

PRIVATE COST: This proposed amendment will not cost private enti-
ties more than five hundred dollars ($500) in the aggregate.

NOTICE TO SUBMIT COMMENTS: Anyone may file a statement in
support of or in opposition to this proposed amendment with the
Missouri Department of Agriculture, PO Box 630, Jefferson City,
MO 65102. To be considered, comments must be received within thir-
ty (30) days after publication of this notice in the Missouri Register.
No public hearing is scheduled.

1141

Proposed Rules

Proposed Amendment Text Reminder:
Boldface text indicates new matter.
[Bracketed text indicates matter being deleted.]

Under this heading will appear the text of proposed rules
and changes. The notice of proposed rulemaking is

required to contain an explanation of any new rule or any
change in an existing rule and the reasons therefor. This is set
out in the Purpose section with each rule. Also required is a
citation to the legal authority to make rules. This appears fol-
lowing the text of the rule, after the word  “Authority.”

Entirely new rules are printed without any special symbol-
ogy under the heading of the proposed rule. If an exist-

ing rule is to be amended or rescinded, it will have a heading
of proposed amendment or proposed rescission. Rules which
are proposed to be amended will have new matter printed in
boldface type and matter to be deleted placed in brackets.

An important function of the Missouri Register is to solicit
and encourage public participation in the rulemaking

process. The law provides that for every proposed rule,
amendment, or rescission there must be a notice that anyone
may comment on the proposed action. This comment may
take different forms.

If an agency is required by statute to hold a public hearing
before making any new rules, then a Notice of Public

Hearing will appear following the text of the rule. Hearing
dates must be at least thirty (30) days after publication of the
notice in the Missouri Register. If no hearing is planned or
required, the agency must give a Notice to Submit
Comments. This allows anyone to file statements in support
of or in opposition to the proposed action with the agency
within a specified time, no less than thirty (30) days after pub-
lication of the notice in the Missouri Register. 

An agency may hold a public hearing on a rule even
though not required by law to hold one. If an agency

allows comments to be received following the hearing date,
the close of comments date will be used as the beginning day
in the ninety (90)-day-count necessary for the filing of the
order of rulemaking.

If an agency decides to hold a public hearing after planning
not to, it must withdraw the earlier notice and file a new

notice of proposed rulemaking and schedule a hearing for a
date not less than thirty (30) days from the date of publication
of the new notice.

MISSOURI

REGISTER
August 1, 2012
Vol. 37, No. 15



August 1, 2012
Vol. 37, No. 15Page 1142 Proposed Rules



Title 2—DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE
Division 90—Weights and Measures

Chapter 10—Liquefied Petroleum Gases

PROPOSED AMENDMENT

2 CSR 90-10.001 Definitions and General Provisions. The com-
mission is adding new language to section (1).

PURPOSE: This amendment clarifies one (1) term previously not
defined.

(1) Definitions. The following words and phrases shall mean: 
(B) “Autogas,” term used for liquefied petroleum gas (LP gas)

when it is used as a fuel in internal combustion engines in vehi-
cles for highway use;

[(B)](C) “Commission,” the Missouri Propane Gas Commission; 
[(C)](D) “Compressed natural gas” (CNG), a mixture of hydro-

carbon gases and vapors, consisting principally of methane in
gaseous form that has been compressed for use as a vehicular fuel; 

[(D)](E) “Director,” the executive director of the commission;
[(E)](F) “Director of the Missouri Department of Agriculture,”

the director of the Missouri Department of Agriculture or their
designee; 

[(F)](G) “Dispensing station,” a system of compressors, safety
devices, cylinders, piping, fittings, valves, regulators, gauges, relief
devices, vents, installation fixtures, and other compressed natural gas
equipment intended for use in conjunction with motor vehicle fuel-
ing by compressed natural gas but does not include a natural gas
pipeline located upstream of the inlet of the compressor; 

[(G)](H) “Liquefied petroleum gas,” any material which is com-
posed predominantly of any of the following hydrocarbons, or mix-
tures of the same: propane, propylene, butanes (normal butane or
isobutane), and butylenes; 

[(H)](I) “Motor vehicle,” all vehicles except those operated on
rails which are propelled by internal combustion engines and are
used or designed for use in the transportation of a person or persons
or property; 

[(I)](J) “Person,” any individual, group of individuals, partner-
ship, association, cooperative, corporation, or any other entity; 

[(J)](K) “Producer,” the owner of the propane at the time it is
recovered at a manufacturing facility, irrespective of the state where
production occurs; 

[(K)](L) “Propane,” propane, butane, mixtures of propane and
butane, and liquefied petroleum gas, as defined by the National Fire
Protection Association Standard 58 for the storage and handling of
liquefied petroleum gases; 

[(L)](M) “Public member,” a member of the commission who is
a resident of Missouri, is a user of odorized propane, and is not relat-
ed by the third degree of consanguinity to any retailer or wholesale
distributor of propane; 

[(M)](N) “Retail marketer,” a business engaged primarily in sell-
ing propane gas, its appliances, and equipment to the ultimate con-
sumer or to retail propane dispensers; 

[(N)](O) “Transport,” combination vehicle or vehicle used to haul
propane for non-metered delivery; and

[(O)](P) “Wholesaler,” “broker,” or “reseller,” a seller of
propane who is not a producer and who does not sell propane to the
ultimate consumer.

AUTHORITY: section 323.010, RSMo Supp. [2010] 2011. Original
rule filed Oct. 15, 2008, effective March 30, 2009. Amended: Filed
June 13, 2011, effective Jan. 30, 2012. Amended: Filed June 26,
2012.

PUBLIC COST: This proposed amendment will not cost state agen-
cies or political subdivisions more than five hundred dollars ($500)

in the aggregate.

PRIVATE COST: This proposed amendment will not cost private enti-
ties more than five hundred dollars ($500) in the aggregate.

NOTICE TO SUBMIT COMMENTS: Anyone may file a statement in
support of or in opposition to this proposed amendment with the
Missouri Department of Agriculture, Missouri Propane Gas
Commission, 4110 Country Club Drive, Suite 200, Jefferson City, MO
65109. To be considered, comments must be received within thirty
(30) days after publication of this notice in the Missouri Register. No
public hearing is scheduled.

Title 2—DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE
Division 90—Weights and Measures

Chapter 10—Liquefied Petroleum Gases

PROPOSED AMENDMENT

2 CSR 90-10.011 Inspection Authority—Duties. The commission
is amending sections (1) and (3).

PURPOSE: This amendment clarifies the authority and duties of the
inspection authority and incorporates references to new editions of
the applicable national standards being adopted by rule. These rules
do not apply to public utilities regulated by the Missouri Public
Service Commission.

(1) The director is the officer in charge of the safety in the storage,
handling, [transportation,] and use of liquefied petroleum gas of
the Missouri Propane Gas Commission referred to as the inspection
authority.

(3) The standards for storage and handling of [LPGs] LP gases and
the standards for the installation of gas appliances and gas piping as
published in the National Fire Protection Association publications,
Numbers 54, [2009] 2012 edition; 58, [2008] 2011 edition; and
1192, [2008] 2011 edition. All publications are published by the
National Fire Protection Association, 1 Batterymarch Park, Quincy,
MA 02269-9101, which are incorporated by reference, and will be
adhered to by the inspection authority in the course of administering
its duties. This rule does not incorporate any subsequent amendments
or additions to the referenced material. These are adopted as rules in
2 CSR 90-10.020, 2 CSR 90-10.040, 2 CSR 90-10.060, and 2 CSR
90-10.090.

AUTHORITY: section 323.020, RSMo Supp. [2010] 2011. Original
rule filed July 13, 1977, effective Nov. 11, 1977. For intervening his-
tory, please consult the Code of State Regulations. Amended: Filed
June 26, 2012.

PUBLIC COST: This proposed amendment will not cost state agen-
cies or political subdivisions more than five hundred dollars ($500)
in the aggregate.

PRIVATE COST: This proposed amendment will not cost private enti-
ties more than five hundred dollars ($500) in the aggregate.

NOTICE TO SUBMIT COMMENTS: Anyone may file a statement in
support of or in opposition to this proposed amendment with the
Missouri Department of Agriculture, Missouri Propane Gas
Commission, 4110 Country Club Drive, Suite 200, Jefferson City, MO
65109. To be considered, comments must be received within thirty
(30) days after publication of this notice in the Missouri Register. No
public hearing is scheduled.

Page 1143
August 1, 2012
Vol. 37, No. 15 Missouri Register



Title 2—DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE
Division 90—Weights and Measures

Chapter 10—Liquefied Petroleum Gases

PROPOSED AMENDMENT

2 CSR 90-10.012 Registration—Training. The commission is
amending sections (3), (4), and (5).

PURPOSE: This amendment eliminates the term “transporting.”

(3) All persons applying for registration to engage in the business of
handling[,] or storing[, or transporting] LP gases or in the busi-
ness of installing, repairing, or servicing piping, equipment, or
appliances for use with LP gases shall be properly trained and expe-
rienced in the work, familiar with all safety precautions required,
and comply with all requirements of Chapter 323, RSMo, and the
rules pursuant to it.  

(4) Every individual applying for registration to engage in the busi-
ness of handling[,] or storing[, or transporting] LP gases or in the
business of installing, repairing, or servicing piping, equipment, or
appliances for use with LP gases must score at least seventy-five per-
cent (75%) on a written examination administered or authorized by
the Missouri Propane Gas Commission before approval of registra-
tion will be granted.

(5) Every individual handling LP gases or servicing appliances or
equipment within any business involved in handling[,] or storing[, or
transporting] LP gases or involved in the installation, repairing, or
servicing of piping, equipment, or appliances for use with LP gases
must attend and complete an initial training program as defined in 2
CSR 90-10.012(6), including the passing of a written examination.
Every individual subject to the requirements of this section shall
attend refresher training at least once every three (3) years. New
employees shall be trained by their employer until such time that
training is available through a training program approved by the
director. The employer, or individual if self-employed, is responsible
for ensuring compliance with this section.

AUTHORITY: section 323.020, RSMo Supp. [2010] 2011. Original
rule filed July 13, 1977, effective Nov. 11, 1977. For intervening his-
tory, please consult the Code of State Regulations. Amended: Filed
June 26, 2012.

PUBLIC COST: This proposed amendment will not cost state agen-
cies or political subdivisions more than five hundred dollars ($500)
in the aggregate.

PRIVATE COST: This proposed amendment will not cost private enti-
ties more than five hundred dollars ($500) in the aggregate.

NOTICE TO SUBMIT COMMENTS: Anyone may file a statement in
support of or in opposition to this proposed amendment with the
Missouri Department of Agriculture, Missouri Propane Gas
Commission, 4110 Country Club Drive, Suite 200, Jefferson City, MO
65109. To be considered, comments must be received within thirty
(30) days after publication of this notice in the Missouri Register. No
public hearing is scheduled.

Title 2—DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE
Division 90—Weights and Measures

Chapter 10—Liquefied Petroleum Gases

PROPOSED AMENDMENT

2 CSR 90-10.013 Installation Requirements. The commission is

amending sections (1), (4), (7), (8), and (9) and deleting sections (5)
and (6). 

PURPOSE: This amendment brings existing state rules into compli-
ance with national codes and establishes a form for the submission
of site plans. It is also adding the term “autogas” and eliminating the
exception for hot air balloons.

(1) Prior to any installations at buildings of public assembly or use
such as schools, churches, recreational halls, tourist courts, hotels,
hospitals, sanitariums, convalescent homes, nursing homes, rest
homes, four- (4-)[-] unit apartments, and larger or similar types of
public buildings having institutional occupancies, for new construc-
tion, major renovations or additions to these installations and mobile
home parks, shopping center areas, service stations, bulk plants,
industrial plants, and other similar locations of public gathering,
form MPGC-[0955]0910 must be completed and submitted to the
inspection authority. Form MPGC-[0955]0910, [March 1, 2011]
January 1, 2012, is published by the Missouri Propane Gas
Commission, 4110 Country Club Dr., Ste. 200, Jefferson City, MO
65109-0302 and is incorporated by reference. This rule does not
incorporate any subsequent amendments or additions to the refer-
enced material.

(3) Form MPGC-0910 including detailed plans shall be furnished to
the inspection authority for approval before installation of LP gas
containers having a water capacity of over two thousand (2,000) gal-
lons, or two (2) or more containers that are to be connected and have
a combined capacity exceeding four thousand (4,000) gallons, or
when LP gas in the liquid phase is to be withdrawn or of a contain-
er charging plant where portable containers are to be recharged and
filled regardless of the capacity of the storage containers used as the
supply for filling containers and cylinders. Form MPGC-0910,
[March 1, 2011] January 1, 2012, is published by the Missouri
Propane Gas Commission, 4110 Country Club Dr., Ste. 200,
Jefferson City, MO 65109-0302 and incorporated by reference. This
rule does not incorporate any subsequent amendments or additions to
the referenced material. When approval is granted, one (1) copy of
the plans will be returned to the party submitting the original pro-
posal. Final inspection and approval is required before placing the
installation into service. If installation of the proposed LP gas system
has not begun within one hundred eighty (180) days from the date of
approval by the state LP gas inspection authority, new plans shall be
resubmitted prior to the time installation does begin.

(4) The following requirements shall be met on plans that shall be
submitted to the inspection authority of Missouri for approval before
starting construction:

(A) [Two] A complete [copies] copy of the plans shall be sub-
mitted to the inspection authority together with detailed specifica-
tions;

(B) Plans shall be on good quality paper, legible, and contain the
information required by this section; and

(C) Plans and specifications are to be accompanied by a written
application on a form prescribed by the inspection authority and shall
include the following:

1. The address of the proposed location and the name and mail-
ing address of the owner or builder;

2. An outline of the boundary lines of the property owned or
leased;

3. A diagram showing adjoining property on all sides and the
distance to all adjacent buildings and roadways;

4. A diagram showing the location and sizes of each container
or containers on the plot of ground to be used;

5. A diagram pinpointing each location where liquid transfer
will be made, such as loading, unloading, and bottling;

6. A general layout of piping, pipe supports, and pipe protection;
the location, size, and type of each important piece of equipment, gate

Page 1144 Proposed Rules
August 1, 2012
Vol. 37, No. 15



valve, excess flow valve, pressure relief valve, hose, regulator, and
all other important parts of the system planned;

7. The location of each building or shed to be built on the prop-
erty and each sewer or drain opening;

8. The location of electrical lines and poles and telephone poles
if located twenty-five feet (25') or less from storage tanks or liquid
transfer areas;

9. The location of the electrical service pole;
10. The location of fences;
11. The dimensions of tank foundations, footings, reinforce-

ments, and tank clearance above ground level;
12. Storage container dimensions, whether new or used, and the

name of the manufacturer; and
13. All used containers of two thousand (2,000) gallons water

capacity or more to be reinstalled shall have all valves, including
relief valves, removed and inspected[; and].

[(D) All electrical equipment in vaporizer houses, pump
houses and cylinder filling rooms or other similar locations
shall be of the type approved for use in Class 1, Group D,
Hazardous Locations, of the National Electrical Code.]

[(5) All installations for use of LPGs in containers of sixty to
one hundred ten (60–110) pounds, LPG capacity, shall be
provided with adequate and safe means of protection to
assure that the cylinder is supported in its installed position
and that there is reasonable protection from the elements.]

[(6) All commercial, industrial, and institutional LP gas stor-
age systems shall be accessible for emergency firefighting
equipment.]

[(7)](5) All LP gas storage tanks shall be installed a minimum dis-
tance of twenty feet (20') from all other Class I, II, and III liquids.
In the event of a hazardous location, the LP gas inspection authority
may require a greater distance and location up to a maximum dis-
tance of one hundred feet (100'). Distance may be reduced to ten
feet (10') when diked.

[(8)](6) All LP gas dispensers shall have form MPGC-0910 and site
plans submitted as required by sections (3) and (4). 

[(9)](7) All tanks of one thousand one (1,001) gallons aggregate
water capacity or greater being used for liquid withdrawal shall have
form MPGC-0910 and site plans submitted as required by sections
(3) and (4).

[(10)](8) All LP gas and autogas dispensers shall have recommend-
ed fill procedures posted [in a conspicuous location].

(A) All dispensers in the retail business of refilling [of] cylinders
shall be equipped with a state-approved scale to be utilized for the
safe filling of LP gas cylinders. LP gas cylinders of one hundred
(100) pounds propane capacity or less shall be filled by weight only
utilizing a state-approved scale. Cylinders of one hundred (100)
pounds capacity or less shall not be filled from any LP gas delivery
vehicle. [An exception may be made by the inspection author-
ity for cylinders utilized in hot air balloon service if the cylin-
ders are approved for such service, have an accurate
approved method of gauging, are in good condition, and are
filled in a safe location away from any source of ignition.]

[(11)](9) All leak checks shall be performed as per [2009] 2012
NFPA 54 8.2. Documentation shall be kept on file.

AUTHORITY: section 323.020, RSMo Supp. [2010] 2011. Original
rule filed July 13, 1977, effective Nov. 11, 1977. For intervening his-
tory, please consult the Code of State Regulations. Amended: Filed
June 26, 2012.

PUBLIC COST: This proposed amendment will not cost state agen-
cies or political subdivisions more than five hundred dollars ($500)
in the aggregate.

PRIVATE COST: This proposed amendment will not cost private enti-
ties more than five hundred dollars ($500) in the aggregate.

NOTICE TO SUBMIT COMMENTS: Anyone may file a statement in
support of or in opposition to this proposed amendment with the
Missouri Department of Agriculture, Missouri Propane Gas
Commission, 4110 Country Club Drive, Suite 200, Jefferson City, MO
65109. To be considered, comments must be received within thirty
(30) days after publication of this notice in the Missouri Register. No
public hearing is scheduled.

Title 2—DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE
Division 90—Weights and Measures

Chapter 10—Liquefied Petroleum Gases

PROPOSED AMENDMENT

2 CSR 90-10.014 Storage. The commission is amending sections
(1), (3), and (7) and eliminating section (4) with subsequent renum-
bering.

PURPOSE: This amendment eliminates or clarifies existing state
requirements that duplicate or conflict with national codes adopted
by the authority.

(1) All liquefied petroleum gas (LP gas) storage containers or stor-
age systems where one (1) tank is used having a water capacity of
one hundred (100) gallons or more, or where two (2) or more tanks
are used having a total combined capacity of more than one hundred
(100) gallons, and all related equipment located at or near contain-
ers which are installed [on school grounds, public playgrounds,
recreation park grounds or any other playground areas where
children in age groups from preschool through grade twelve
(12) have access] within twenty-five feet (25') of a playground
where children in age groups of preschool through grade twelve
(12) have access shall be fenced with industrial type fence a mini-
mum of six feet (6') high as to prevent tampering with the gas pip-
ing system.

(3) Containers of any size shall not be used for storage other than
manufacturer’s design and specifications; i.e., railcars, converted
railcars, bulk delivery truck tanks both transport and bobtail cannot
be utilized for fixed storage. A variance for bobtail delivery truck
tanks may be requested. A written request must be submitted to
the commission on form MPGC-0417 included herein.

[(4) All LP gas bulk storage containers, of four thousand
(4,000) gallons water capacity (WC) or more shall have its
pumps, piping, vaporizers, hoses, bulkheads, and related
equipment protected from tampering by a metal chain link or
equivalent industrial-type fence at least six feet (6') tall. All
locations with one hundred (100) square feet or less fenced
area shall have at least one (1) lockable access gate. All
locations with more than one hundred (100) square feet
fenced shall have at least two (2) lockable access gates.]

[(5)](4) All aboveground LP gas storage containers shall be kept
properly painted with a light reflective paint such as white or alu-
minum.

Page 1145
August 1, 2012
Vol. 37, No. 15 Missouri Register



[(6)](5) All aboveground LP gas storage containers, two thousand
(2,000) water capacity (WC) or more, and all dispensers shall be
clearly marked PROPANE, FLAMMABLE, NO SMOKING on two
(2) sides in a conspicuous location of the dispenser housing, fencing,
or a combination thereof. All wording shall be in block-style letters
with a minimum height of two inches (2") and a minimum width of
one-fourth inch (1/4") on a contrasting background.

[(7)](6) Each LP gas bulk plant or system of two thousand (2,000)
gallons WC or more and all dispensers engaged in retail shall have a
sign displayed in a conspicuous location stating the name and tele-
phone number of the nearest representative, agent, or owner of the
system. All wording shall be in block-style letters with a mini-
mum height of one inch (1") and on a contrasting background.

[(8)](7) Any LP gas storage container, including any container used
for motor fuel, which has been damaged in any manner shall be
repaired according to the requirements of the code it was manufac-
tured under and shall be hydrostatically tested prior to placing in ser-
vice.

[(9)](8) Repair of any LP gas container shell, excluding valves, fit-
tings, regulators, and attachments, shall be in conformance with the
code under which the container was manufactured, and all repairs
shall be performed only by a person certified under the code by
which the container was manufactured.

[(10)](9) A copy of all container data information and repairs to the
container shall be submitted to the inspection authority for review
prior to installation of the container.

[(11)](10) LP gas storage containers supplying mobile home parks,
schools, hospitals, domestic systems, or other public or institutional
facilities shall not be utilized as a bulk storage plant for loading LP
gas into any fuel delivery vessel or vehicle.

[(12)](11) At a bulk storage facility that the owner declares out-of-
service, the tank or tanks shall be empty, only contain residual pres-
sure, and be capped or plugged as close as practical to the positive
shut-off valve just outside the tank or tanks. Before placing the tank
or plant back into operation, form MPGC-0910 including detailed
plans shall be furnished to the inspection authority for approval and
approval must be granted by the inspection authority. Form MPGC-
0910, [March 1, 2011] January 1, 2012, is published by the
Missouri Propane Gas Commission, 4110 Country Club Dr., Ste.
200, Jefferson City, MO 65109-0302 and is incorporated by refer-
ence. This rule does not incorporate any subsequent amendments or
additions to the referenced material.

Page 1146 Proposed Rules
August 1, 2012
Vol. 37, No. 15



Page 1147
August 1, 2012
Vol. 37, No. 15 Missouri Register



AUTHORITY: section 323.020, RSMo Supp. [2010] 2011. Original
rule filed July 13, 1977, effective Nov. 11, 1977. For intervening his-
tory, please consult the Code of State Regulations. Amended: Filed
June 26, 2012.

PUBLIC COST: This proposed amendment will not cost state agen-
cies or political subdivisions more than five hundred dollars ($500)
in the aggregate.

PRIVATE COST: This proposed amendment will not cost private enti-
ties more than five hundred dollars ($500) in the aggregate.

NOTICE TO SUBMIT COMMENTS: Anyone may file a statement in
support of or in opposition to this proposed amendment with the
Missouri Department of Agriculture, Missouri Propane Gas
Commission, 4110 Country Club Drive, Suite 200, Jefferson City, MO
65109. To be considered, comments must be received within thirty
(30) days after publication of this notice in the Missouri Register. No
public hearing is scheduled.

Title 2—DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE
Division 90—Weights and Measures

Chapter 10—Liquefied Petroleum Gases

PROPOSED AMENDMENT

2 CSR 90-10.020 NFPA Manual No. 54, National Fuel Gas Code.
The commission is amending section (1).

PURPOSE: This amendment incorporates references to new editions
of the applicable national standards being adopted by rule.

(1) Standards contained in National Fire Protection Association
(NFPA) Manual No. 54, National Fuel Gas Code, [2009] 2012 edi-
tion, published by the National Fire Protection Association, 1
Batterymarch Park, Quincy, MA 02269-9101, are incorporated here-
in by reference. This rule does not incorporate any subsequent
amendments or additions to the referenced material. The balance of
this rule sets forth requirements for liquefied petroleum gas (LP gas)
applications not covered in the manual. The scope of National Fire
Protection Association (NFPA) Manual No. 54, National Fuel Gas
Code, [2009] 2012 edition, is to develop fire safety codes, stan-
dards, recommended practices, and manuals, as may be considered
desirable, covering the installation of piping and appliances using
fuel gases such as natural gas, manufactured gas, liquefied petrole-
um gas, and liquefied petroleum gas-air mixture.

AUTHORITY: section 261.023.6., RSMo 2000, and section 323.020,
RSMo Supp. [2010] 2011. Original rule filed Jan. 24, 1968, effec-
tive Feb. 3, 1968. For intervening history, please consult the Code of
State Regulations. Amended: Filed June 26, 2012.

PUBLIC COST: This proposed amendment will not cost state agen-
cies or political subdivisions more than five hundred dollars ($500)
in the aggregate.

PRIVATE COST: This proposed amendment will not cost private enti-
ties more than five hundred dollars ($500) in the aggregate.

NOTICE TO SUBMIT COMMENTS: Anyone may file a statement in
support of or in opposition to this proposed amendment with the
Missouri Department of Agriculture, Missouri Propane Gas
Commission, 4110 Country Club Drive, Suite 200, Jefferson City, MO
65109. To be considered, comments must be received within thirty
(30) days after publication of this notice in the Missouri Register. No
public hearing is scheduled.

Title 2—DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE
Division 90—Weights and Measures

Chapter 10—Liquefied Petroleum Gases

PROPOSED AMENDMENT

2 CSR 90-10.040 NFPA Manual No. 58, Storage and Handling of
Liquefied Petroleum Gases. The commission is amending section
(1)  and eliminating section (4). 

PURPOSE: This amendment reconciles the current version of
Missouri’s adopted propane code to the applicable national standard
and brings existing state rules into compliance with national codes

(1) This rule incorporates by reference National Fire Protection
Association (NFPA) Manual No. 58, Storage and Handling of
Liquefied Petroleum Gases, [2008] 2011 edition, published by the
National Fire Protection Association, 1 Batterymarch Park, Quincy,
MA 02269-9101, as the current standard for the storage and handling
of liquefied petroleum gases (LP gas). This rule does not incorporate
any subsequent amendments or additions to the referenced material.

[(4) The written Fire Safety Analysis, required by the 2008
edition of the National Fire Protection Association’s
Pamphlet 58, Liquefied Petroleum Gas Code, 6.25.3, pub-
lished by the National Fire Protection Association, 1
Batterymarch Park, Quincy, MA 02269-9101, and incorpo-
rated by reference, shall be prepared by a person approved
by the Missouri Propane Gas Commission, who has relevant
experience and is knowledgeable of the practices of the LP
gas industry.  Except for an engineered facility, the Fire
Safety Analysis may be prepared by the owner of the facili-
ty in cooperation with the local fire department and/or Fire
Marshall. The Fire Safety Analysis for an engineered facility,
such as one that incorporates refrigerated storage, automat-
ed fuel standby (either industrial or utility) or pipeline termi-
nals, shall be prepared, stamped, and signed by a profes-
sional engineer who has relevant experience in LP gas or fire
protection. This rule does not incorporate any subsequent
amendments or additions to the referenced material.]

AUTHORITY: section 261.023.6., RSMo 2000, and section 323.020,
RSMo Supp. [2010] 2011. Original rule filed Jan. 24, 1968, effec-
tive Feb. 3, 1968. For intervening history, please consult the Code of
State Regulations. Amended: Filed June 26, 2012.

PUBLIC COST: This proposed amendment will not cost state agen-
cies or political subdivisions more than five hundred dollars ($500)
in the aggregate.

PRIVATE COST: This proposed amendment will not cost private enti-
ties more than five hundred dollars ($500) in the aggregate.

NOTICE TO SUBMIT COMMENTS: Anyone may file a statement in
support of or in opposition to this proposed amendment with the
Missouri Department of Agriculture, Missouri Propane Gas
Commission, 4110 Country Club Drive, Suite 200, Jefferson City, MO
65109. To be considered, comments must be received within thirty
(30) days after publication of this notice in the Missouri Register. No
public hearing is scheduled.

Title 2—DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE
Division 90—Weights and Measures

Chapter 10—Liquefied Petroleum Gases

PROPOSED AMENDMENT

2 CSR 90-10.090 NFPA Manual No. 1192, Chapter 5, Standard

Page 1148 Proposed Rules
August 1, 2012
Vol. 37, No. 15



for Recreational Vehicles. The commission is amending section (1).

PURPOSE: This amendment reconciles the current version of
Missouri’s adopted propane code to the applicable national stan-
dard.

(1) The scope of National Fire Protection Association Manual No.
1192, Chapter 5, Standard on Recreational Vehicles, [2008] 2011
edition, published by the National Fire Protection Association, 1
Batterymarch Park, Quincy, MA 02269-9101, covers the heat pro-
ducing appliances and fuel systems within or on recreational vehi-
cles. Whenever nationally recognized standards for heat producing
appliances and fuel systems and this Chapter 5 differ, the require-
ments of the latter shall apply.

AUTHORITY: section 323.020, RSMo Supp. [2010] 2011. Original
rule filed May 13, 1977, effective Jan. 13, 1978. For intervening his-
tory, please consult the Code of State Regulations. Amended: Filed
June 26, 2012.

PUBLIC COST: This proposed amendment will not cost state agen-
cies or political subdivisions more than five hundred dollars ($500)
in the aggregate.

PRIVATE COST: This proposed amendment will not cost private enti-
ties more than five hundred dollars ($500) in the aggregate.

NOTICE TO SUBMIT COMMENTS: Anyone may file a statement in
support of or in opposition to this proposed amendment with the
Missouri Department of Agriculture, Missouri Propane Gas
Commission, 4110 Country Club Drive, Suite 200, Jefferson City, MO
65109. To be considered, comments must be received within thirty
(30) days after publication of this notice in the Missouri Register. No
public hearing is scheduled.

Title 2—DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE
Division 90—Weights and Measures

Chapter 10—Liquefied Petroleum Gases

PROPOSED AMENDMENT

2 CSR 90-10.120 Reporting of Odorized LP Gas Release, Fire, or
Explosion. The commission is amending section (1).

PURPOSE: This amendment eliminates duplication of national codes
adopted by the authority.

(1) [In addition to NFPA 58, 2008 edition, 14.4.3.3, at] At
the earliest practical moment or within two (2) hours following dis-
covery, the owner, manager, or operator of a vehicle or equipment
regulated by this chapter shall notify the Missouri Propane Gas
Commission by telephone of any event involving odorized liquefied
petroleum gas (LP gas) release, fire, or explosion which:

(E) Could reasonably be judged as significant because of rerouting
of traffic, [or] evacuation of buildings, or media interest; or 

AUTHORITY: section 323.025, RSMo Supp. [2010] 2011. Original
rule filed June 13, 2011, effective Jan. 30, 2012. Amended: Filed
June 26, 2012.

PUBLIC COST: This proposed amendment will not cost state agen-
cies or political subdivisions more than five hundred dollars ($500)
in the aggregate.

PRIVATE COST: This proposed amendment will not cost private enti-
ties more than five hundred dollars ($500) in the aggregate.

NOTICE TO SUBMIT COMMENTS: Anyone may file a statement in

support of or in opposition to this proposed amendment with the
Missouri Department of Agriculture, Missouri Propane Gas
Commission, 4110 Country Club Drive, Suite 200, Jefferson City, MO
65109. To be considered, comments must be received within thirty
(30) days after publication of this notice in the Missouri Register. No
public hearing is scheduled.

Title 3—DEPARTMENT OF CONSERVATION
Division 10—Conservation Commission

Chapter 7—Wildlife Code: Hunting: Seasons, Methods,
Limits

PROPOSED AMENDMENT

3 CSR 10-7.433 Deer: Firearms Hunting Seasons. The commis-
sion proposes to amend subsections (1)(D) and (5)(C) of this rule. 

PURPOSE: This amendment renames this muzzleloader portion of
the fall firearms deer season to more accurately reflect the new
methods allowed.

(1) The firearms deer hunting season is comprised of six (6) por-
tions.  

(D) [Muzzleloader] Alternative methods portion: December 15
through 25, 2012; use muzzleloader and archery methods, cross-
bows, atlatl, handguns, and air-powered guns as defined in 3 CSR
10-7.431 to take deer statewide.  

(5) Feral hogs, defined as any hog, including Russian and European
wild boar, not conspicuously identified by ear tags or other forms of
identification and roaming freely on public or private lands without
the landowner’s permission (refer to section 270.400 of Missouri
Revised Statutes), may be taken in any number during the firearms
deer hunting season as follows: 

(C) During the youth and [muzzleloader] alternative methods
portions statewide and the urban zones portion in open counties— 

1. Deer permittees may only use methods allowed for deer; and
2. Small game permittees may only use methods allowed for

small game.

AUTHORITY: sections 40 and 45 of Art. IV, Mo. Const. and section
252.240, RSMo 2000. Original rule filed April 29, 2004, effective
May 15, 2004. For intervening history, please consult the Code of
State Regulations. Amended: Filed July 2, 2012.

PUBLIC COST: This proposed amendment will not cost state
agencies or political subdivisions more than five hundred dollars
($500) in the aggregate.

PRIVATE COST: This proposed amendment will not cost private
entities more than five hundred dollars ($500) in the aggregate.

NOTICE TO SUBMIT COMMENTS: Anyone may file a statement in
support of or in opposition to this proposed amendment with Tom A.
Draper, Deputy Director, Department of Conserva tion, PO Box 180,
Jefferson City, MO 65102-0180. To be considered, comments must be
received within thirty (30) days after publication of this notice in the
Missouri Register. No public hearing is scheduled.

Title 13—DEPARTMENT OF SOCIAL SERVICES
Division 40—Family Support Division

Chapter 2—Income Maintenance

PROPOSED RULE

13 CSR 40-2.400 Definitions for the Screening and Testing for the
Illegal Use of Controlled Substances by Temporary Assistance

Page 1149
August 1, 2012
Vol. 37, No. 15 Missouri Register



Applicants and Recipients 

PURPOSE: This rule establishes the definitions that will govern the
use of certain terms used to establish the procedures for the screen-
ing and testing for illegal use of controlled substances by Temporary
Assistance applicants and recipients.

(1) Applicant—A person who has applied for Temporary Assistance
benefits in accordance with Temporary Assistance eligibility regula-
tions, but has not yet been determined eligible for benefits.

(2) Appropriate substance abuse treatment program—A substance
abuse treatment program that the Department of Mental Health has
approved and—

(A) Is certified as an alcohol and drug abuse treatment program by
the Department of Mental Health; and 

(B) Is contracted with the Department of Mental Health to provide
Comprehensive Substance Treatment and Rehabilitation (CSTAR)
services.

(3) Drug test—The urine dipstick five- (5-) panel test.

(4) Entry into the substance abuse treatment program—A recipient
shall be considered to have entered into a substance abuse treatment
program when the recipient has been enrolled in the Department of
Mental Health’s consumer information system by an appropriate
treatment provider.

(5) Controlled substance—a drug, substance, or immediate precursor
in Schedules I through V listed in sections 195.005 to 195.425,
RSMo.

(6) Head-of-household—The individual who is registered as the
applicant or recipient for Temporary Assistance benefits with the
division.

(7) Individual—A person who is either an applicant or recipient for
Temporary Assistance benefits with the Family Support Division.

(8) Misdemeanor or felony drug offense—Any arrests or convictions
for violating any federal or Missouri state statutes relating to any ille-
gal use, possession, trafficking, delivery, distribution, registration,
creation, production, or manufacturing of any drugs, narcotics, con-
trolled substances, controlled substance analogues, imitation con-
trolled substances, drug paraphernalia, counterfeit substances, or
immediate precursor shall constitute the misdemeanor or felony drug
offenses that shall be screened for by a search of the records of the
Missouri Highway Patrol.

(9) Protective payee—An individual appointed by the Family Support
Division to act on behalf of the Temporary Assistance household
with regard to Temporary Assistance benefits.

(10) Reasonable cause—Reasonable cause exists when there is rea-
sonable suspicion that there is an articulable individualized basis for
suspecting that the Temporary Assistance applicant or recipient is
engaging in the illegal use of controlled substances. Reasonable sus-
picion shall be deemed to exist based on the response to the screen-
ing tool or when a search of the law enforcement records of the
Missouri Highway Patrol establishes that the individual has been
arrested or convicted of a misdemeanor or felony drug offense with-
in the last twelve (12) months.

(11) Recipient—A person who receives public assistance benefits in
accordance with Temporary Assistance eligibility regulations.

(12) Successful completion of substance abuse treatment program—
A recipient referred under section 208.027, RSMo, has successfully

completed a substance abuse program when a letter or other official
notice is issued from the appropriate substance abuse treatment pro-
gram verifying the recipient has made satisfactory progress toward
the criteria outlined in 9 CSR 30-3.130(8)(A) and if the recipient has
not tested positive in accordance with 13 CSR 40-2.420.

(13) Temporary Assistance (TA)—Missouri’s Temporary Assistance
for Needy Families program that provides temporary cash assistance
to families as set forth in sections 208.040, RSMo, et seq. and 13
CSR 40-2.300 to 13 CSR 40-2.370.

(14) Temporary Assistance for Needy Families (TANF)—The feder-
al program under which Missouri’s Temporary Assistance benefits
are distributed as set forth in 42 U.S.C. section 601, et seq. and 42
CFR 260.10, et seq.

(15) Treatment provider—Is an individual or entity that operates a
substance abuse treatment program that the Department of Mental
Health has approved and—

(A) Is certified as an alcohol and drug abuse treatment program by
the Department of Mental Health; and 

(B) Is contracted with the Department of Mental Health to provide
Comprehensive Substance Treatment and Rehabilitation (CSTAR)
services.

(16) Urine dipstick five- (5-) panel test—A test that will analyze an
individual’s urine sample to determine whether an individual has
used the following controlled substances:

(A) Amphetamines/Methamphetamines;
(B) Cannabinoids (THC);
(C) Cocaine;
(D) Opiates; and
(E) Phencyclidine (PCP).

AUTHORITY: section 208.027, RSMo Supp. 2011. Original rule filed
June 29, 2012.

PUBLIC COST: This proposed rule will not cost state agencies or
political subdivisions more than five hundred dollars ($500) in the
aggregate.

PRIVATE COST: This proposed rule will not cost private entities
more than five hundred dollars ($500) in the aggregate.

NOTICE TO SUBMIT COMMENTS: Anyone may file a statement in
support of or in opposition to this proposed rule with the Department
of Social Services, Family Support Division, PO Box 2320, Jefferson
City, MO 65102-2320. To be considered, comments must be received
within thirty (30) days after publication of this notice in the Missouri
Register.

Title 13—DEPARTMENT OF SOCIAL SERVICES
Division 40—Family Support Division

Chapter 2—Income Maintenance

PROPOSED RULE

13 CSR 40-2.410 Screening Temporary Assistance Applicants
and Recipients for Illegal Use of a Controlled Substance 

PURPOSE: This rule adds the requirement that all applicants or
recipients for the payment of Temporary Assistance who are age eigh-
teen (18) or older and are the head-of-household complete a screen-
ing for illegal use of a controlled substance. This rule also estab-
lishes the individual’s eligibility due to the screening and conse-
quences when the individual fails to comply with the screening
requirement and when the screening provides reasonable cause for

Page 1150 Proposed Rules
August 1, 2012
Vol. 37, No. 15



illegal use of a controlled substance.

(1) The Family Support Division shall conduct a screening to deter-
mine illegal use of a controlled substance for all Temporary
Assistance applicants and recipients who are age eighteen (18) or
older, are the head of the household, and are otherwise eligible for
Temporary Assistance benefits as defined in 13 CSR 40-2.300
through 13 CSR 40-2.370.

(A) The individual must cooperate with the screening process.
1. The individual must agree to complete the screening process.
2. The individual must answer all questions.

(B) Screening shall consist of the following two (2) processes:
1. The individual shall submit answers to a screening tool

administrated by the Family Support Division at the time of applica-
tion; and

2. The Family Support Division shall conduct a periodic match
of Temporary Assistance recipients with the Missouri Highway Patrol
law enforcement records for individuals that have an arrest or con-
viction for a misdemeanor or felony drug offense upon implementa-
tion of the screening process.

(C) The individual may request referral to and then must success-
fully complete an appropriate substance abuse treatment program as
set forth in 13 CSR 40-2.430 in lieu of a drug test as set forth in 13
CSR 40-2.420 at his/her request.

1. The division shall not provide Temporary Assistance to or on
behalf of an individual who refuses or fails to cooperate with the
screening process. The individual is ineligible for Temporary
Assistance for a period of three (3) years from the date of the admin-
istrative hearing decision if the division is affirmed. The hearing
process is set forth in 13 CSR 40-2.440.

(2) The individual shall submit to a urine dipstick five- (5-) panel
drug test, as defined in 13 CSR 40-2.420 if—

(A) The individual’s response to the screening tool gives rise to
reasonable suspicion the individual engages in the illegal use of a
controlled substance; or

(B) An individual has an arrest or conviction for a misdemeanor
or felony drug offense from the match with the Missouri Highway
Patrol within the preceding twelve (12) months of the date of the
match with the Missouri Highway Patrol. 

(3) The Temporary Assistance application or receipt of Temporary
Assistance benefits constitutes consent to obtain all relevant infor-
mation necessary to determine whether the individual engages in the
illegal use of a controlled substance.

AUTHORITY: section 208.027, RSMo Supp. 2011.  Original rule filed
June 29, 2012.  

PUBLIC COST: This proposed rule will cost state agencies or polit-
ical subdivisions one hundred sixty-three thousand nine hundred
twenty dollars ($163,920) in the aggregate in state fiscal year 2013.  

PRIVATE COST: This proposed rule will not cost private entities
more than five hundred dollars ($500) in the aggregate.

NOTICE TO SUBMIT COMMENTS:  Anyone may file a statement in
support of or in opposition to this proposed rule with the Department
of Social Services, Family Support Division, PO Box 2320, Jefferson
City, MO  65102-2320.  To be considered, comments must be received
within thirty (30) days after publication of this notice in the Missouri
Register.

Page 1151
August 1, 2012
Vol. 37, No. 15 Missouri Register



August 1, 2012
Vol. 37, No. 15Page 1152 Proposed Rules



Page 1153
August 1, 2012
Vol. 37, No. 15 Missouri Register



Title 13—DEPARTMENT OF SOCIAL SERVICES
Division 40—Family Support Division

Chapter 2—Income Maintenance

PROPOSED RULE

13 CSR 40-2.420 Testing for the Illegal Use of a Controlled
Substance by Applicants and Recipients of Temporary Assistance 

PURPOSE: This rule adds the requirement that applicants for
Temporary Assistance and recipients for the payment of Temporary
Assistance who are age eighteen (18) or older and are the head-of-
household whose screening for illegal use of a controlled substance
establishes reasonable cause to believe the individual engages in the
illegal use of a controlled substance must submit to a urine dipstick
five- (5-) panel drug test. This rule also establishes the individual’s
ineligibility for Temporary Assistance pursuant to the drug testing
requirement.

(1) The Family Support Division shall require an individual to sub-
mit to a urine dipstick five- (5-) panel drug test when the Family
Support Division determines there is reasonable cause to believe the
individual is engaging in the illegal use of a controlled substance.
The determination of reasonable cause shall be based upon the
screening process set forth in 13 CSR 40-2.410.   

(A) The division or its designee shall notify the individual in writ-
ing of the reasonable cause determination that requires the individual
to submit to a urine dipstick five- (5-) panel drug test.

(B) The division or its designee shall notify the individual in writ-
ing of the location of the test and the date by which the test must be
completed and of the drug testing process.

(C) The division or its designee shall make the test available with-
in the individual’s county of residence as known to the division.

(D) The individual must provide verification of identity when sub-
mitting to the drug test. Acceptable forms of identity verification
include: U.S. passport; driver’s license issued by the state or U.S.
territory with a photograph or other identifying information; certifi-
cate of degree of Indian blood; school identification card; U.S. mil-
itary card or draft card with photograph; identification card issued by
federal, state, or local government; and Native American tribal doc-
ument.

(2) The division shall not provide Temporary Assistance to or on
behalf of an individual who is required to submit to a drug test and
who refuses or fails to cooperate with any part of the drug testing
process.

(A) Refusal to cooperate shall include:
1. Failure to provide a sample for drug testing within the

required time frame;
2. Failure to fully comply with the drug testing process as

directed by the Family Support Division or its designee;
3. Failure to appear for drug testing at the designated location

and time;
4. Failure to contact or cooperate with any medical review

process.
A. Cooperation with the medical review process shall

include, but is not limited to: 
(I) An interview; and
(II) Providing copies of medical records needed to confirm

the result of the drug testing; 
5. Failure to provide verification of identity; and
6. Failure to complete any documents or consent forms required

by the Family Support Division or its designee, the drug testing
provider, the Department of Mental Health, or the substance abuse
treatment provider.

(B) The individual is ineligible for Temporary Assistance for a
period of three (3) years from the date of the administrative hearing
decision if the division is affirmed.  The hearing process is set forth

in 13 CSR 40-2.440.

(3) The division shall not provide Temporary Assistance to or on
behalf of an individual who tests positive for illegal use of a con-
trolled substance and fails to enter, participate, and successfully com-
plete an appropriate substance abuse treatment program as set forth
in 13 CSR 40-2.430.  The individual is ineligible for Temporary
Assistance for a period of three (3) years from the date of the admin-
istrative hearing decision if the division is affirmed. The hearing
process is set forth in 13 CSR 40-2.440.

(4) The division may require a urine dipstick five- (5-) panel drug
test at six (6) months from the date the recipient entered the sub-
stance abuse treatment program as defined in 13 CSR 40-2.430. If
the individual tests positive, the individual is ineligible for
Temporary Assistance for a period of three (3) years from the date of
the administrative hearing decision if the division is affirmed. The
hearing process is set forth in 13 CSR 40-2.440.

(5) The amount of assistance that would otherwise be required to be
provided under the Temporary Assistance Program to the family
members of an individual to whom sections (2), (3), and (4) apply
shall be reduced by the amount which would have otherwise been
made available to the individual who has been declared ineligible.

(6) The division shall add an otherwise eligible individual who has
been declared ineligible for Temporary Assistance as set forth in 13
CSR 40-2.400 through 13 CSR 40-2.430 to the Temporary
Assistance household after the three- (3-) year period of ineligibility
has elapsed. The individual is subject to the rules as set forth in 13
CSR 40-2.400 through 13 CSR 40-2.450.

AUTHORITY: section 208.027, RSMo Supp. 2011. Original rule filed
June 29, 2012.

PUBLIC COST: This proposed rule will cost state agencies or polit-
ical subdivisions three hundred thirty-four thousand, two hundred
ninety-seven dollars ($334,297) in the aggregate in state fiscal year
2013.  

PRIVATE COST: This proposed rule will not cost private entities
more than five hundred dollars ($500) in the aggregate.

NOTICE TO SUBMIT COMMENTS: Anyone may file a statement in
support of or in opposition to this proposed rule with the Department
of Social Services, Family Support Division, PO Box 2320, Jefferson
City, MO  65102-2320.  To be considered, comments must be received
within thirty (30) days after publication of this notice in the Missouri
Register.

Page 1154 Proposed Rules
August 1, 2012
Vol. 37, No. 15



Page 1155
August 1, 2012
Vol. 37, No. 15 Missouri Register



August 1, 2012
Vol. 37, No. 15Page 1156 Proposed Rules



Title 13—DEPARTMENT OF SOCIAL SERVICES
Division 40—Family Support Division

Chapter 2—Income Maintenance

PROPOSED RULE

13 CSR 40-2.430 Substance Abuse Treatment Program for
Temporary Assistance Recipients

PURPOSE:  This rule explains the referral and treatment process for
recipients of Temporary Assistance benefits who are required to enter
and complete a substance abuse treatment program as a result of 13
CSR 40-2.420.  

(1) The Family Support Division shall refer recipients of Temporary
Assistance benefits who are determined to have tested positive for the
illegal use of a controlled substance under the provisions of section
208.027, RSMo, to an appropriate substance abuse treatment pro-
gram approved by the Department of Mental Health, as set forth in
13 CSR 40-2.400.  

(2) Recipients referred to an approved substance abuse treatment pro-
gram as set forth in these rules shall receive a comprehensive assess-
ment to determine the appropriate level of care and to develop an ini-
tial treatment plan. Treatment services shall be delivered in accor-
dance with all rules applicable to certified programs as defined in 9
CSR 30-3.032.

(3) Active participation in the substance abuse treatment program by
recipients referred as provided in section 208.027, RSMo, shall be
demonstrated by—

(A) Completion of comprehensive assessment as set forth in sec-
tion (2);

(B) Enrollment in an appropriate substance abuse treatment pro-
gram;

(C) Consent to communication between and among the treatment
provider, Family Support Division, and Department of Mental
Health personnel about participation and progress in substance abuse
treatment; and

(D) Participation in the development of an individualized treatment
plan and satisfactory progress toward treatment goals.

(4) The Department of Mental Health or the treatment provider shall
inform the Family Support Division in writing within five (5) days of
the following:

(A) The date the recipient enters into the substance abuse treat-
ment program; and

(B) The date upon which the recipient successfully completed the
substance abuse treatment program; and 

(C) The date the recipient did not successfully complete the sub-
stance abuse treatment program.

(5) The written notice(s) required in section (4) shall be signed by
the treatment provider. The original, signed notice(s) shall be self-
authenticating and shall be admissible into evidence without further
foundation at any hearing conducted under 13 CSR 40-2.440. The
hearing officer may authorize a substitution of the original with a
copy for the record. If the division or the recipient objects to the
introduction of the notice(s) into evidence, the party making the
objection shall have the burden to establish that the notice(s) is not
authentic and should not be admitted into evidence. The recipient or
the division may request that the hearing officer issue a subpoena to
the treatment provider for examination or cross-examination on the
record.

AUTHORITY: section 208.027, RSMo Supp. 2011. Original rule filed
June 29, 2012.

PUBLIC COST: This proposed rule will cost state agencies or polit-
ical subdivisions $1,940,280 in the aggregate in state fiscal year
2013.

PRIVATE COST: This proposed rule will not cost private entities
more than five hundred dollars ($500) in the aggregate.

NOTICE TO SUBMIT COMMENTS: Anyone may file a statement in
support of or in opposition to this proposed rule with the Department
of Social Services, PO Box 1527, Jefferson City, MO 65102-1527.  To
be considered, comments must be received within thirty (30) days
after publication of this notice in the Missouri Register.

Page 1157
August 1, 2012
Vol. 37, No. 15 Missouri Register



August 1, 2012
Vol. 37, No. 15Page 1158 Proposed Rules



Title 13—DEPARTMENT OF SOCIAL SERVICES
Division 40—Family Support Division

Chapter 2—Income Maintenance

PROPOSED RULE

13 CSR 40-2.440 Hearings for Proceedings under 13 CSR 40-
2.400 through 13 CSR 40-2.450

PURPOSE: This rule adds the requirement that all applicants or
recipients for Temporary Assistance benefits who are age eighteen
(18) or older and are the head-of-household who refuses or fails to
cooperate with the screening process, who refuses to submit to a drug
test, or who tests positive for the illegal use of controlled substances
and fails to participate in a substance abuse treatment program will
have a hearing.  This rule establishes the procedures to be followed
in the hearing.

(1) Eligibility for Hearing. 
(A) Any applicant for or recipient of Temporary Assistance shall

have an automatic administrative hearing before the director of the
Family Support Division or his/her designee when he/she—

1. Refuses or fails to cooperate with the screening process;
2. Refuses or fails to submit to a drug test; or 
3. Tests positive for the illegal use of controlled substances for

the first time.  
(B) Any applicant for or recipient of Temporary Assistance may

request the director of the Family Support Division provide an
administrative hearing before the director of the Family Support
Division or his/her designee when he/she—

1. Does not participate in an appropriate substance abuse treat-
ment program after having been ordered to participate in a treatment
program following an administrative hearing;

2. Fails to successfully complete an appropriate substance abuse
treatment program after having been ordered to participate in a treat-
ment program following an administrative hearing; or 

3. Tests positive for the illegal use of controlled substances a
subsequent time. 

(2) Notification of Adverse Action and Hearings.  
(A) Notice(s). The Family Support Division shall notify the indi-

vidual in writing of any action affecting his/her Temporary
Assistance benefit(s) as set forth in subsection (1)(A) or (1)(B). The
notification shall be sent by mail to his/her address of record at least
ten (10) days before the date the action becomes effective. The indi-
vidual has the duty to notify the Family Support Division of any
change in his/her residence address, mailing address, and other con-
tact information. 

1. The notice for the automatic administrative hearings required
under subsection (1)(A) shall meet the requirements set out in Chap-
ter 536, RSMo, the hearing requirements in 45 CFR section 205.10,
this regulation, and any other applicable federal statutes or regula-
tions.

2. The notice for administrative hearings made upon request
under subsection (1)(B) shall meet the requirements set out in sec-
tion 208.080, RSMo, the hearing requirements in 45 CFR section
205.10, this regulation, and any other applicable federal statutes or
regulations. The individual shall have ninety (90) days from the date
of the notice of the action affecting his/her Temporary Assistance
benefit(s) in which to request an appeal to the director of the Fami-
ly Support Division. 

(B) Hearings.
1. The automatic administrative hearings required under sub-

section (1)(A) shall be conducted pursuant to procedures set forth in
Chapter 536, RSMo, the hearing requirements in 45 CFR section
205.10, this regulation, and any other applicable federal statutes or
regulations by administrative hearing officers designated by the
director of the Family Support Division.

2. The administrative hearings made upon request under sub-
section (1)(B) shall be conducted pursuant to procedures set forth in
section 208.080, RSMo, the hearing requirements in 45 CFR section
205.10, this regulation, and any other applicable federal statutes or
regulations by administrative hearing officers designated by the
director of the Family Support Division.

(3) Hearing Procedure. The following procedure shall apply to all
administrative hearings required by either subsection (1)(A) or
(1)(B).  

(A) Notice. The hearing officer shall mail a notice of the hearing
to the Family Support Division, the individual at his/her address of
record, and if appropriate, to the individual’s attorney or designated
representative.  The notice shall include any information required by
either Chapter 208, RSMo, Chapter 536, RSMo, 45 CFR section
205.10, or any other federal statutes or regulations that are applica-
ble to the hearing being conducted under the authority of either sub-
section (1)(A) or (1)(B).  In addition, the following information shall
be included in every hearing notice:

1. The caption and number of the case;
2. The time and place of the hearing;
3. The subject of the hearing;
4. An order will be entered in accordance with the adverse

action notice if the individual fails to appear and participate at the
hearing;

5. Information on how to contact the hearing officer to request
an in-person hearing if the individual has a need for a special accom-
modation due to a disability; and

6. The individual may represent him/herself or the individual
may authorize another individual, such as legal counsel or relative,
to act as a representative. 

(B) No answer or responsive pleading shall be required to respond
to any notice affecting his/her Temporary Assistance benefit(s)
mailed by the Family Support Division or notice of an administrative
hearing provided for under this regulation.

(C) The hearing officer shall set the date and time for the hearing.
The hearing may be continued once on request of the individual or
the Family Support Division. 

(D) The hearing shall be conducted by telephone if the individual
agrees, or at the local office of the Family Support Division. 

(E) The Family Support Division shall have the burden to estab-
lish by a preponderance of the evidence that the individual—

1. Tested positive for the illegal use of a controlled substance;  
2. Failed or refused to cooperate or submit to the screening as

set forth in 13 CSR 40-2.410;  
3. Failed or refused to cooperate or submit to the test for ille-

gal use of a controlled substance as required by 13 CSR 40-2.420;
4. Failed or refused to sign any required consent form required

by 13 CSR 40-2.400 through 13 CSR 40-2.430;
5. Failed or refused to participate in an appropriate substance

abuse treatment program as set forth in 13 CSR 40-2.420; or
6. Failed or refused to successfully complete substance abuse

treatment as set forth in 13 CSR 40-2.440.
(F) Affirmative Defenses. The individual shall have the burden of

proving the following affirmative defenses. Failure to comply with
any of the requirements of subsection (3)(F) shall be cause to con-
sider the individual as having waived the affirmative defenses set
forth below.

1. The individual was prescribed drugs by a licensed physician
that resulted in the positive test for the illegal use of controlled sub-
stances. It shall be presumed that the ingestion of medication pre-
scribed to someone other than the individual subject to the test for
illegal use of controlled substances required under section 208.027,
RSMo, will not constitute an affirmative defense to excuse or negate
the positive test result for the illegal use of a controlled substance.

2. The individual has a medical condition that prevented the
individual from submitting a sample for testing for illegal use of con-
trolled substances or from completing an appropriate substance

Page 1159
August 1, 2012
Vol. 37, No. 15 Missouri Register



abuse treatment program. The assertion of this affirmative defense
shall be governed by the following rule:

A. The individual must produce a copy of medical records
and a written report from the individual’s physician providing the
medical diagnosis along with any supporting medical tests and exam-
inations that establish the existence of the medical condition that the
individual asserts prevented compliance with the testing for illegal
use of controlled substances or from completing an appropriate sub-
stance abuse treatment program.

(G) Evidence at the Hearing.
1. Written medical reports, medical records, reports of medical

review officers, chain of custody documentation, drug test results,
treatment records from an appropriate substance abuse treatment
program, laboratory reports and results, and the contents of the
aforementioned documents submitted by the individual or the Fami-
ly Support Division at the hearing are declared to be competent evi-
dence and admissible into evidence at the hearing to be considered
by the hearing officer along with any other evidence or testimony
submitted.

2. Written medical reports, medical records, reports of medical
review officers, chain of custody documentation, drug test results,
treatment records from an appropriate substance abuse treatment
program, laboratory reports and results, and the contents of the
aforementioned documents purporting to be executed and signed by
the medical doctor or other appropriate authority, its agents or
employees accompanied by a business record affidavit that meets the
requirements of section 490.692, RSMo, shall be prima facia evi-
dence of it being properly executed and signed without further proof
of identification.

3. Written medical reports, medical records, reports of medical
review officers, chain of custody documentation, drug test results,
treatment records from an appropriate substance abuse treatment
program, laboratory reports and results, and the contents of the
aforementioned documents reporting a positive drug test result shall
create a rebuttable presumption that the individual has tested positive
for the illegal use of a controlled substance in violation of section
208.027, RSMo, or has failed to successfully complete an appropri-
ate substance abuse treatment program. The entry of the written
medical reports, medical records, reports of medical review officers,
chain of custody documentation, drug test results, treatment records
from an appropriate substance abuse treatment program, laboratory
reports and results, and the contents of the aforementioned docu-
ments reporting a positive drug test result or the failure to success-
fully complete an appropriate substance abuse treatment program
into evidence at the administrative hearing required by either sub-
section (1)(A) or (1)(B) shall shift the burden of proof to the indi-
vidual to refute the presumption.

(H) The hearing shall be on the record. 

(4) The hearing officer in an administrative hearing required by
either subsection (1)(A) or (1)(B) shall make specific written find-
ings of fact and conclusions of law pertinent to the questions in issue.
The findings of fact and conclusions of law shall be based solely
upon the evidence introduced into the record at the hearing. Copies
of the decision of the hearing officer shall be mailed to the individ-
ual and their attorney at law or legal guardian and the Family Sup-
port Division.

(5) Judicial Review.
(A) Any applicant for or recipient of Temporary Assistance who

has an automatic administrative hearing under subsection (1)(A) may
obtain judicial review pursuant to sections 536.100 to 536.140,
RSMo.

(B) Any applicant for or recipient of Temporary Assistance who
may request the director provide an administrative hearing under
subsection (1)(B) may obtain judicial review pursuant to section
208.100, RSMo.  

AUTHORITY: section 208.027, RSMo Supp. 2011.  Original rule filed
June 29, 2012.

PUBLIC COST: This proposed rule will cost state agencies or polit-
ical subdivisions one hundred eighty thousand eight hundred eighty-
eight dollars ($180,888) in state fiscal year 2013.  

PRIVATE COST: This proposed rule will not cost private entities
more than five hundred dollars ($500) in the aggregate.

NOTICE TO SUBMIT COMMENTS:  Anyone may file a statement in
support of or in opposition to this proposed rule with the Department
of Social Services, PO Box 1527, Jefferson City, MO  65102-1527.
To be considered, comments must be received within thirty (30) days
after publication of this notice in the Missouri Register. 

Page 1160 Proposed Rules
August 1, 2012
Vol. 37, No. 15



Page 1161
August 1, 2012
Vol. 37, No. 15 Missouri Register



August 1, 2012
Vol. 37, No. 15Page 1162 Proposed Rules



Title 13—DEPARTMENT OF SOCIAL SERVICES
Division 40—Family Support Division

Chapter 2—Income Maintenance

PROPOSED RULE

13 CSR 40-2.450 Assignment of a Protective Payee Over
Temporary Assistance Benefits When the Head of Household is
Declared Ineligible for Temporary Assistance Pursuant to 13
CSR 40-2.400 through 13 CSR 40-2.440 

PURPOSE: This rule adds the requirement that all recipients for
Temporary Assistance benefits who are age eighteen (18) or older and
are the head-of-household and who become ineligible as set forth in
13 CSR 40-2.400 through 13 CSR 40-2.440 will have a protective
payee assigned to administer the Temporary Assistance benefit.

(1) The Family Support Division shall require the assignment of a
protective payee any time the Temporary Assistance head-of-house-
hold refuses to complete the screening process as set forth in 13 CSR
40-2.410.

(2) The Family Support Division shall require the assignment of a
protective payee any time the Temporary Assistance head-of-house-
hold refuses to submit to a drug test for the illegal use of a controlled
substance as set forth in 13 CSR 40-2.420.

(3) The Family Support Division shall require the assignment of a
protective payee any time the Temporary Assistance head-of-house-
hold tests positive for the illegal use of a controlled substance and
does not enter or successfully complete a substance abuse treatment
program as set forth in 13 CSR 40-2.430.

(4) The Family Support Division shall designate the protective payee,
within forty-five (45) days of the administrative hearing decision that
affirms the division as outlined in 13 CSR 40-2.440, or when a new
protective payee must be designated.

(A) A relative, friend, clergy person, or other qualified adult may
be designated as the protective payee.

(B) The protective payee shall certify to the division he/she meets
the following qualifications before being appointed to be a protective
payee: 

1. Over the age of twenty-one (21);
2. Able to read, write, and willing and able to act in a fiducia-

ry capacity to handle funds on behalf of another person;
3. Has the ability to keep his/her current residence and mailing

address on file at all times with the Family Support Division and
keep the individual and other household members informed of
his/her current address and contact information; 

4. Able to maintain records and account for the use of funds as
provided in this regulation;

5. The Department of Social Services has not established a
claim against him/her for fraud or misuse arising from any program
administered by the Department of Social Services; 

6. Has not been convicted, pled guilty or nolo contendere, or
received a suspended imposition of sentence (regardless of whether
incarceration actually occurred) of any felony;

7. Has not been convicted, pled guilty or nolo contendere, or
received a suspended imposition of sentence (regardless of whether
incarceration actually occurred) of any misdemeanor set forth in
Chapter 570, RSMo; 

8. Has not been convicted, pled guilty or nolo contendere, or
received a suspended imposition of sentence (regardless of whether
incarceration actually occurred) of any misdemeanor involving the
use and/or possession of controlled substances; 

9. Has not been convicted, pled guilty or nolo contendere, or
received a suspended imposition of sentence (regardless of whether
incarceration actually occurred) of any misdemeanor involving the

ineligible individual or a family member that is in the Temporary
Assistance household; 

10. Has not been placed on the central registry maintained by
the Department of Social Services for any actions or inaction involv-
ing the ineligible individual or a family member that is in the
Temporary Assistance household;  and

11. Has no civil or criminal court order that hinders the ability
of the protective payee to perform any duties as provided in this reg-
ulation.  

(C) The protective payee has an affirmative obligation to notify the
division of any changes in circumstances that would affect his/her
qualifications to serve as protective payee as set forth in section (4)
including changes in his/her address or contact information within
ten (10) days of the change.

(5) A person shall not be qualified to serve as a protective payee
under the following circumstances: 

(A) The person does not meet the qualifications set out in section
(4) of this regulation; or

(B) The person makes any false statements in the certification as
set out in section (4) of this regulation.

(6) Responsibilities of the protective payee include:
(A) Acting in a fiduciary capacity on behalf of the members of the

Temporary Assistance household when receiving and using the
Temporary Assistance benefits under this regulation; 

(B) Keeping receipts and other records necessary and appropriate
to document how he or she has spent or otherwise utilized the
Temporary Assistance benefits paid to the protective payee under this
regulation; 

(C) Providing an accounting to the individual, to other household
members or their legal representative and/or the Family Support
Division for the receipt and expenditure of all Temporary Assistance
benefits paid under this regulation; and 

(D) Providing copies of the receipts and other documents to the
individual or the division upon request.

(7) The protective payee must use the Temporary Assistance benefits
as follows:

(A) To meet the needs of the Temporary Assistance household.
Approved uses may include, but are not limited to the following
examples: clothing, food, household supplies such as cleaning sup-
plies and sanitary supplies, medicine, school supplies for children in
the household, utility payments, rent, and activities for the children;

(B) Shall not be used to meet the needs of the protective payee or
to compensate the protective payee for managing the Temporary
Assistance benefits;

(C) Shall not be given to or used in any way to benefit the ineligi-
ble individual, or an individual or entity that does not provide a need
for the Temporary Assistance household;

(D) Shall not be utilized to purchase controlled substances without
a prescription from a licensed health care professional; and

(E) Any payments made to the protective payee that are utilized in
violation of this regulation shall be considered a misuse of
Temporary Assistance benefits. 

(8) The Family Support Division may remove and designate a new
protective payee when—

(A) The protective payee fails to use the benefits as set out in sec-
tion (7) of this regulation;

(B) The protective payee fails to meet the qualifications in section
(4); and

(C) A protective payee who has been previously removed shall be
disqualified from serving as a protective payee under this regulation.

(9) The Family Support Division may remove the protective payee at
such time when the head-of-household is no longer ineligible for
Temporary Assistance benefits as set forth in 13 CSR 40-2.400
through 13 CSR 40-2.440.

Page 1163
August 1, 2012
Vol. 37, No. 15 Missouri Register



AUTHORITY: section 208.027, RSMo Supp. 2011. Original rule filed
June 29, 2012.

PUBLIC COST: This proposed rule will not cost state agencies or
political subdivisions more than five hundred dollars ($500) in the
aggregate.

PRIVATE COST: This proposed rule will not cost private entities
more than five hundred dollars ($500) in the aggregate.

NOTICE TO SUBMIT COMMENTS:  Anyone may file a statement in
support of or in opposition to this proposed rule with the Department
of Social Services, PO Box 1527, Jefferson City, MO 65102-1527.  To
be considered, comments must be received within thirty (30) days
after publication of this notice in the Missouri Register.

Title 13—DEPARTMENT OF SOCIAL SERVICES
Division 70—MO HealthNet Division
Chapter 10—Nursing Home Program

PROPOSED AMENDMENT

13 CSR 70-10.016 Global Per Diem Adjustments to Nursing
Facility and HIV Nursing Facility Reimbursement Rates. The
division is adding paragraph (3)(A)16.

PURPOSE: This amendment provides for a per diem increase to
nursing facility and HIV nursing facility reimbursement rates by
granting a trend adjustment resulting in an increase of six dollars
and zero cents ($6.00) effective for dates of service beginning July 1,
2012.

(3) Adjustments to the Reimbursement Rates. Subject to the limita-
tions prescribed in 13 CSR 70-10.015, a nursing facility’s reim-
bursement rate may be adjusted as described in this section.  Subject
to the limitations prescribed in 13 CSR 70-10.080, an HIV nursing
facility’s reimbursement rate may be adjusted as described in this
section.

(A) Global Per Diem Rate Adjustments. A facility with either an
interim rate or a prospective rate may qualify for the global per diem
rate adjustments.  Global per diem rate adjustments shall be added
to the specified cost component ceiling.

1. FY-96 negotiated trend factor—
A. Facilities with either an interim rate or prospective rate in

effect on October 1, 1995, shall be granted an increase to their per
diem effective October 1, 1995, of four and six-tenths percent
(4.6%) of the cost determined in paragraphs (11)(A)1., (11)(B)1.,
(11)(C)1., and the property insurance and property taxes detailed in
subsection (11)(D) of 13 CSR 70-10.015; or 

B. Facilities that were granted a prospective rate based on
paragraph (12)(A)2. of 13 CSR 70-10.015 that is in effect on
October 1, 1995, shall have their increase determined by subsection
(3)(S) of 13 CSR 70-10.015.

2. FY-97 negotiated trend factor—
A. Facilities with either an interim rate or prospective rate in

effect on October 1, 1996, shall be granted an increase to their per
diem effective October 1, 1996, of three and seven-tenths percent
(3.7%) of the cost determined in paragraphs (11)(A)1., (11)(B)1.,
(11)(C)1., and the property insurance and property taxes detailed in
subsection (11)(D) of 13 CSR 70-10.015; or

B. Facilities that were granted a prospective rate based on
paragraph (12)(A)2. of 13 CSR 70-10.015 that is in effect on
October 1, 1995, shall have their increase determined by subsection
(3)(S) of 13 CSR 70-10.015. 

3. Nursing Facility Reimbursement Allowance (NFRA).
Effective October 1, 1996, all facilities with either an interim rate or
a prospective rate shall have its per diem adjusted to include the cur-

rent NFRA as an allowable cost in its reimbursement rate calcula-
tion. 

4. Minimum wage adjustment. All facilities with either an inter-
im rate or a prospective rate in effect on November 1, 1996, shall be
granted an increase to their per diem effective  November 1, 1996,
of two dollars and forty-five cents ($2.45) to allow for the change in
minimum wage. Utilizing Fiscal Year 1995 cost report data, the total
industry hours reported for each payroll category was multiplied by
the fifty-cent (50¢) increase, divided by the patient days for the facil-
ities reporting hours for that payroll category and factored up by
eight and sixty-seven hundredths percent (8.67%) to account for the
related increase to payroll taxes. This calculation excludes the direc-
tor of nursing, the administrator, and assistant administrator.

5. Minimum wage adjustment. All facilities with either an inter-
im rate or a prospective rate in effect on September 1, 1997, shall be
granted an increase to their per diem effective September 1, 1997,
of one dollar and ninety-eight cents ($1.98) to allow for the change
in minimum wage. Utilizing Fiscal Year 1995 cost report data, the
total industry hours reported for each payroll category was multiplied
by the forty-cent (40¢) increase, divided by the patient days for the
facilities reporting hours for that payroll category and factored up by
eight and sixty-seven hundredths percent (8.67%) to account for the
related increase to payroll taxes. This calculation excludes the direc-
tor of nursing, the administrator, and assistant administrator.

6. FY-98 negotiated trend factor—
A. Facilities with either an interim rate or prospective rate in

effect on October 1, 1997, shall be granted an increase to their per
diem effective October 1, 1997, of three and four-tenths percent
(3.4%) of the cost determined in paragraphs (11)(A)1., (11)(B)1.,
(11)(C)1., and the property insurance and property taxes detailed in
subsection (11)(D) of 13 CSR 70-10.015 for nursing facilities and 13
CSR 70-10.080 for HIV nursing facilities; or  

B. Facilities that were granted a prospective rate based on
paragraph (12)(A)2. of 13 CSR 70-10.015 that is in effect on
October 1, 1995, shall have their increase determined by subsection
(3)(S) of 13 CSR 70-10.015.

7. FY-99 negotiated trend factor—
A. Facilities with either an interim rate or prospective rate in

effect on October 1, 1998, shall be granted an increase to their per
diem effective October 1, 1998, of two and one-tenth percent (2.1%)
of the cost determined in paragraphs (11)(A)1., (11)(B)1., (11)(C)1.,
the property insurance and property taxes detailed in subsection
(11)(D) of 13 CSR 70-10.015 for nursing facilities and 13 CSR 70-
10.080 for HIV nursing facilities, and the minimum wage adjust-
ments detailed in paragraphs (3)(A)4. and (3)(A)5. of this regulation;
or

B. Facilities that were granted a prospective rate based on
paragraph (12)(A)2. of 13 CSR 70-10.015 that is in effect on
October 1, 1998, shall have their increase determined by subsection
(3)(S) of 13 CSR 70-10.015. 

8. FY-2000 negotiated trend factor—
A. Facilities with either an interim rate or prospective rate in

effect on July 1, 1999, shall be granted an increase to their per diem
effective July 1, 1999, of one and ninety-four hundredths percent
(1.94%) of the cost determined in subsections (11)(A), (11)(B),
(11)(C), the property insurance and property taxes detailed in sub-
section (11)(D) of 13 CSR 70-10.015 for nursing facilities and 13
CSR 70-10.080 for HIV nursing facilities, and the minimum wage
adjustments detailed in paragraphs (3)(A)4. and (3)(A)5. of this reg-
ulation; or

B. Facilities that were granted a prospective rate based on
paragraph (12)(A)2. of 13 CSR 70-10.015 that is in effect on July 1,
1999, shall have their increase determined by subsection (3)(S) of 13
CSR 70-10.015.

9. FY-2004 nursing facility operations adjustment— 
A. Facilities with either an interim rate or prospective rate in

effect on July 1, 2003, shall be granted an increase to their per diem
effective for dates of service beginning July 1, 2003, through June

Page 1164 Proposed Rules
August 1, 2012
Vol. 37, No. 15



30, 2004, of four dollars and thirty-two cents ($4.32) for the cost of
nursing facility operations.  Effective for dates of service beginning
July 1, 2004, the per diem adjustment shall be reduced to three dol-
lars and seventy-eight cents ($3.78).

B. The operations adjustment shall be added to the facility’s
current rate as of June 30, 2003, and is effective for payment dates
after August 1, 2003.

10. FY-2007 quality improvement adjustment—
A. Facilities with either an interim rate or prospective rate in

effect on July 1, 2006, shall be granted an increase to their per diem
effective for dates of service beginning July 1, 2006, of three dollars
and seventeen cents ($3.17) to improve the quality of life for nursing
facility residents.  

B. The quality improvement adjustment shall be added to the
facility’s current rate as of June 30, 2006, and is effective for dates
of service beginning July 1, 2006, and after.  

11. FY-2007 trend adjustment.  
A. Facilities with either an interim rate or a prospective rate

in effect on February 1, 2007, shall be granted an increase to their
per diem rate effective for dates of service beginning February 1,
2007, of three dollars and zero cents ($3.00) to allow for a trend
adjustment to ensure quality nursing facility services.  

B. The trend adjustment shall be added to the facility’s reim-
bursement rate as of January 31, 2007, and is effective for dates of
service beginning February 1, 2007, for payment dates after
March 1, 2007.

12. FY-2008 trend adjustment.  
A. Facilities with either an interim rate or a prospective rate

in effect on July 1, 2007, shall be granted an increase to their per
diem rate effective for dates of service beginning July 1, 2007, of six
dollars and zero cents ($6.00) to allow for a trend adjustment to
ensure quality nursing facility services.   

B. The trend adjustment shall be added to the facility’s cur-
rent rate as of June 30, 2007, and is effective for dates of service
beginning July 1, 2007.

13. FY-2009 trend adjustment.
A. Facilities with either an interim rate or a prospective rate

in effect on July 1, 2008, shall be granted an increase to their per
diem rate effective for dates of service beginning July 1, 2008, of six
dollars and zero cents ($6.00) to allow for a trend adjustment to
ensure quality nursing facility services.   

B. The trend adjustment shall be added to the facility’s cur-
rent rate as of June 30, 2008, and is effective for dates of service
beginning July 1, 2008.

14. FY-2010 trend adjustment.
A. Facilities with either an interim rate or a prospective rate

in effect on July 1, 2009, shall be granted an increase to their per
diem rate effective for dates of service beginning July 1, 2009, of
five dollars and fifty cents ($5.50) to allow for a trend adjustment to
ensure quality nursing facility services.   

B. The trend adjustment shall be added to the facility’s cur-
rent rate as of June 30, 2009, and is effective for dates of service
beginning July 1, 2009.

15. FY-2012 trend adjustment.
A. Facilities with either an interim rate or a prospective rate

in effect on October 1, 2011, shall be granted an increase to their per
diem rate effective for dates of service beginning October 1, 2011,
of six dollars and zero cents ($6.00) to allow for a trend adjustment
to ensure quality nursing facility services.

B. The trend adjustment shall be added to the facility’s cur-
rent rate as of September 30, 2011, and is effective for dates of ser-
vice beginning October 1, 2011.  

C. This increase is contingent upon the federal assessment
rate limit increasing to six percent (6%) and is subject to approval by
the Centers for Medicare and Medicaid Services. 

16. FY-2013 trend adjustment.
A. Facilities with either an interim rate or a prospective

rate in effect on July 1, 2012, shall be granted an increase to their

per diem rate effective for dates of services beginning July 1,
2012, of six dollars and zero cents ($6.00) to allow for a trend
adjustment to ensure quality nursing facility services.

B. The trend adjustment shall be added to the facility’s
current rate as of June 30, 2012, and is effective for dates of ser-
vice beginning July 1, 2012.

C. This increase is contingent upon approval by the
Centers for Medicare and Medicaid Services.  

AUTHORITY: section 208.159, RSMo 2000, and sections 208.153
and 208.201, RSMo Supp. [2010] 2011. Original rule filed July 1,
2008, effective Jan. 30, 2009. For intervening history, please consult
the Code of State Regulations. Amended: Filed June 20, 2012.  

PUBLIC COST: This proposed amendment will cost state agencies or
political subdivisions approximately $53,784,192 in SFY 2013.

PRIVATE COST: This proposed amendment will not cost private enti-
ties more than five hundred dollars ($500) in the aggregate.

NOTICE TO SUBMIT COMMENTS: Anyone may file a statement in
support of or in opposition to this proposed amendment with the
Department of Social Services, MO HealthNet Division,
615 Howerton Court, Jefferson City, MO 65109. To be considered,
comments must be delivered by regular mail, express or overnight
mail, in person, or by courier within thirty (30) days after publica-
tion of this notice in the Missouri Register. If to be hand-delivered,
comments must be brought to the MO HealthNet Division at
615 Howerton Court, Jefferson City, Missouri.  No public hearing is
scheduled.

Page 1165
August 1, 2012
Vol. 37, No. 15 Missouri Register



August 1, 2012
Vol. 37, No. 15Page 1166 Proposed Rules



Title 13—DEPARTMENT OF SOCIAL SERVICES
Division 70—MO HealthNet Division
Chapter 10—Nursing Home Program

PROPOSED AMENDMENT

13 CSR 70-10.110 Nursing Facility Reimbursement Allowance.
The division is adding subsection (2)(O).

PURPOSE: This amendment provides for a change in the Nursing
Facility Reimbursement Allowance rate to twelve dollars and eleven
cents ($12.11) effective for dates of service July 1, 2012. 

(2) NFRA Rates. The NFRA rates determined by the division, as set
forth in subsection (1)(B) above, are as follows:

(M) Effective January 1, 2010, the NFRA will be nine dollars and
twenty-seven cents ($9.27) per patient occupancy day. The applica-
ble quarterly survey shall be as defined in subsection (2)(K); [and]

(N) Effective October 1, 2011, the NFRA will be eleven dollars
and seventy cents ($11.70) per patient occupancy day. The applica-
ble quarterly survey shall be as defined in subsection (2)(K)[.]; and

(O) Effective July 1, 2012, the NFRA will be twelve dollars and
eleven cents ($12.11) per patient occupancy day. The applicable
quarterly survey shall be as defined in subsection (2)(K).

AUTHORITY: sections 198.401, 198.403, 198.406, 198.409,
198.412, 198.416, 198.418, 198.421, 198.424, 198.427, 198.431,
198.433, 198.436, and 208.159, RSMo 2000, and sections 198.439,
208.153, and 208.201, RSMo Supp. [2010] 2011. Emergency rule
filed Dec. 21, 1994, effective Jan. 1, 1995, expired April 30, 1995.
Emergency rule filed April 21, 1995, effective May 1, 1995, expired
Aug. 28, 1995. Original rule filed Dec. 15, 1994, effective July 30,
1995. For intervening history, please consult the Code of State
Regulations. Emergency amendment filed June 20, 2012, effective
July 1, 2012, expires Dec. 28, 2012.  Amended: Filed July 2, 2012.

PUBLIC COST: This proposed amendment will cost state agencies or
political subdivisions approximately $3,675,552 for SFY 2013. 

PRIVATE COST: This proposed amendment will result in a net cost
to private entities of approximately $2,660,605 for SFY 2013 (total
increase in NFRA of $6,102,984 less the increased reimbursement to
nursing facilities due to NFRA being an allowable cost of $3,442,379
yields a net impact of $2,660,605).

NOTICE TO SUBMIT COMMENTS:  Anyone may file a statement in
support of or in opposition to this proposed amendment with the
Department of Social Services, MO HealthNet Division,
615 Howerton Court, Jefferson City, MO 65109. To be considered,
comments must be delivered by regular mail, express or overnight
mail, in person, or by courier within thirty (30) days after publica-
tion of this notice in the Missouri Register. If to be hand-delivered,
comments must be brought to the MO HealthNet Division at
615 Howerton Court, Jefferson City, Missouri.  No public hearing is
scheduled.

Page 1167
August 1, 2012
Vol. 37, No. 15 Missouri Register



August 1, 2012
Vol. 37, No. 15Page 1168 Proposed Rules



Page 1169
August 1, 2012
Vol. 37, No. 15 Missouri Register



August 1, 2012
Vol. 37, No. 15Page 1170 Proposed Rules



Page 1171
August 1, 2012
Vol. 37, No. 15 Missouri Register



Title 13—DEPARTMENT OF SOCIAL SERVICES 
Division 70—MO HealthNet Division 

Chapter 15—Hospital Program

PROPOSED AMENDMENT

13 CSR 70-15.010 Inpatient Hospital Services Reimbursement
Plan; Outpatient Hospital Services Reimbursement
Methodology. The division is amending section (3). 

PURPOSE: This amendment provides for the State Fiscal Year (SFY)
2013 trend factor to be applied in determining FRA funded hospital
payments for SFY 2013.

(3) Per Diem Reimbursement Rate Computation. Each hospital shall
receive a MO HealthNet per diem rate based on the following com-
putation.

(B) Trend Indices (TI). Trend indices are determined based on the
four- (4-)[-] quarter average DRI Index for DRI-Type Hospital
Market Basket as published in Health Care Costs by DRI/McGraw-
Hill for each State Fiscal Year (SFY) 1995 to 1998. Trend indices
starting in SFY 1999 will be determined based on CPI Hospital
indexed as published in Health Care Costs by DRI/McGraw-Hill for
each State Fiscal Year (SFY).

1. The TI are—
A. SFY 1994—4.6%
B. SFY 1995—4.45%
C. SFY 1996—4.575%
D. SFY 1997—4.05%
E. SFY 1998—3.1%
F. SFY 1999—3.8%
G. SFY 2000—4.0%
H. SFY 2001—4.6%
I. SFY 2002—4.8%
J. SFY 2003—5.0%
K. SFY 2004—6.2%
L. SFY 2005—6.7%
M. SFY 2006—5.7%
N. SFY 2007—5.9%
O. SFY 2008—5.5%
P. SFY 2009—5.5%
Q. SFY 2010—3.9%
R. SFY 2011—3.2%—The 3.2% trend shall not be applied in

determining the per diem rate, Direct Medicaid payments, or unin-
sured payments.   

S. SFY 2012—4.0%
T. SFY 2013—4.4%

2. The TI for SFY 1996 through SFY 1998 are applied as a full
percentage to the OC of the per diem rate and for SFY 1999 the OC
of the June 30, 1998, rate shall be trended by 1.2% and for SFY
2000 the OC of the June 30, 1999, rate shall be trended by 2.4%.
The OC of the June 30, 2000, rate shall be trended by 1.95% for
SFY 2001.

3. The per diem rate shall be reduced as necessary to avoid any
negative Direct Medicaid payments computed in accordance with
subsection (15)(B).

4. A facility previously enrolled for participation in the MO
HealthNet Program, which either voluntarily or involuntarily termi-
nates its participation in the MO HealthNet Program and which reen-
ters the MO HealthNet Program, shall have its MO HealthNet rate
determined in accordance with section (4).

AUTHORITY: sections 208.152, 208.153, and 208.201, RSMo Supp.
[2010] 2011. This rule was previously filed as 13 CSR 40-81.050.
Original rule filed Feb. 13, 1969, effective Feb. 23, 1969.  For inter-
vening history, please consult the Code of State Regulations.
Emergency amendment filed June 20, 2012, effective July 1, 2012,
expires Dec. 28, 2012. Amended: Filed June 20, 2012. 

PUBLIC COST: This proposed amendment will cost state agencies or
political subdivisions $87.7 million annually.

PRIVATE COST: This proposed amendment will not cost private enti-
ties more than five hundred dollars ($500) in the aggregate.

NOTICE TO SUBMIT COMMENTS: Anyone may file a statement in
support of or in opposition to this proposed amendment with the
Department of Social Services, MO HealthNet Division,
615 Howerton Court, Jefferson City, MO 65109.  To be considered,
comments must be delivered by regular mail, express or overnight
mail, in person, or by courier within thirty (30) days after publica-
tion of this notice in the Missouri Register. If to be hand-delivered,
comments must be brought to the MO HealthNet Division at
615 Howerton Court, Jefferson City, Missouri.  No public hearing is
scheduled.

Page 1172 Proposed Rules
August 1, 2012
Vol. 37, No. 15



Page 1173
August 1, 2012
Vol. 37, No. 15 Missouri Register



Title 13—DEPARTMENT OF SOCIAL SERVICES 
Division 70—MO HealthNet Division 

Chapter 15—Hospital Program

PROPOSED AMENDMENT

13 CSR 70-15.110 Federal Reimbursement Allowance (FRA).
The division is amending section (1). 

PURPOSE: This amendment provides for the State Fiscal Year (SFY)
2013 trend factor to be applied to the inpatient and outpatient adjust-
ed net revenues determined from the FRA fiscal year cost report.

(1) Federal Reimbursement Allowance (FRA). FRA shall be
assessed as described in this section. 

(A) Definitions. 
1. Bad debts—Amounts considered to be uncollectible from

accounts and notes receivable that were created or acquired in pro-
viding services. Allowable bad debts include the costs of caring for
patients who have insurance, but their insurance does not cover the
particular service procedures or treatment rendered.

2. Base cost report—Desk-reviewed Medi care/Medicaid cost
report. When a hospital has more than one (1) cost report with peri-
ods ending in the base year, the cost report covering a full twelve-
(12-)[-] month period will be used. If none of the cost reports cov-
ers a full twelve (12) months, the cost report with the latest period
will be used. If a hospital’s base cost report is less than or greater
than a twelve- (12-)[-] month period, the data shall be adjusted,
based on the number of months reflected in the base cost report, to
a twelve- (12-)[-] month period. 

3. Charity care—Those charges written off by a hospital based
on the hospital’s policy to provide health care services free of charge
or at a reduced charge because of the indigence or medical indigence
of the patient.

4. Contractual allowances—Difference between established
rates for covered services and the amount paid by third-party payers
under contractual agreements. The Federal Reimbursement
Allowance (FRA) is a cost to the hospital, regardless of how the FRA
is remitted to the MO HealthNet Division, and shall not be included
in contractual allowances for determining revenues. Any redistribu-
tions of MO HealthNet payments by private entities acting at the
request of participating health care providers shall not be included in
contractual allowances or determining revenues or cost of patient
care. 

5. Department—Department of Social Services. 
6. Director—Director of the Department of Social Services. 
7. Division—MO HealthNet Division, Department of Social

Services. 
8. Engaging in the business of providing inpatient health care—

Accepting payment for inpatient services rendered. 
9. Federal Reimbursement Allowance (FRA)—The fee assessed

to hospitals for the privilege of engaging in the business of providing
inpatient health care in Missouri. The FRA is an allowable cost to
the hospital.

10. Fiscal period—Twelve- (12-)[-] month reporting period
determined by each hospital. 

11. Gross hospital service charges—Total charges made by the
hospital for inpatient and outpatient hospital services that are covered
under 13 CSR 70-15.010.

12. Hospital—A place devoted primarily to the maintenance and
operation of facilities for the diagnosis, treatment, or care for not
fewer than twenty-four (24) hours in any week of three (3) or more
nonrelated individuals suffering from illness, disease, injury, defor-
mity, or other abnormal physical conditions; or a place devoted pri-
marily to provide, for not fewer than twenty-four (24) hours in any
week, medical or nursing care for three (3) or more nonrelated indi-
viduals. The term hospital does not include convalescent, nursing,
shelter, or boarding homes as defined in Chapter 198, RSMo. 

13. Hospital revenues subject to FRA assessment effective July
1, 2008—Each hospital’s inpatient adjusted net revenues and outpa-
tient adjusted net revenues subject to the FRA assessment will be
determined as follows:

A. Obtain “Gross Total Charges” from Worksheet G-2, Line
25, Column 3, of the third prior year cost report (i.e., FRA fiscal
year cost report) for the hospital. Charges shall exclude revenues for
physician services. Charges related to activities subject to the
Missouri taxes assessed for outpatient retail pharmacies and nursing
facility services shall also be excluded. “Gross Total Charges” will
be reduced by the following:

(I) “Nursing Facility Charges” from Worksheet C, Part I,
Line 35, Column 6.

(II) “Swing Bed Nursing Facility Charges” from
Worksheet G-2, Line 5, Column 1.

(III) “Nursing Facility Ancillary Charges” as determined
from the Department of Social Services, MO HealthNet Division,
nursing home cost report. (Note: To the extent that the gross hospi-
tal charges, as specified in subparagraph (1)(A)13.A. above, include
long-term care charges, the charges to be excluded through this step
shall include all long-term care ancillary charges including skilled
nursing facility, nursing facility, and other long-term care providers
based at the hospital that are subject to the state’s provider tax on
nursing facility services.)  

(IV) “Distinct Part Ambulatory Surgical Center Charges”
from Worksheet G-2, Line 22, Column 2.

(V) “Ambulance Charges” from Worksheet C, Part I, Line
65, Column 7.

(VI) “Home Health Charges” from Worksheet G-2, Line
19, Column 2.  

(VII) “Total Rural Health Clinic Charges” from Worksheet
C, Part I, Column 7, Lines 63.50–63.59.

(VIII) “Other Non-Hospital Component Charges” from
Worksheet G-2, Lines 6, 8, 21, 21.02, 23, and 24.

B. Obtain “Net Revenue” from Worksheet G-3, Line 3,
Column 1. The state will ensure this amount is net of bad debts and
other uncollectible charges by survey methodology. 

C. “Adjusted Gross Total Charges” (the result of the compu-
tations in subparagraph (1)(A)13.A.) will then be further adjusted by
a hospital-specific collection-to-charge ratio determined as follows: 

(I) Divide “Net Revenue” by “Gross Total Charges”; and
(II) “Adjusted Gross Total Charges” will be multiplied by

the result of part (1)(A)13.C.(I) to yield “Adjusted Net Revenue.”
D. Obtain “Gross Inpatient Charges” from Worksheet G-2,

Line 25, Column 1, of the most recent cost report that is available
for a hospital.

E. Obtain “Gross Outpatient Charges” from Worksheet G-2,
Line 25, Column 2, of the most recent cost report that is available
for a hospital.

F. Total “Adjusted Net Revenue” will be allocated between
“Net Inpatient Revenue” and “Net Outpatient Revenue” as follows:

(I) “Gross Inpatient Charges” will be divided by “Gross
Total Charges”;

(II) “Adjusted Net Revenue” will then be multiplied by the
result to yield “Net Inpatient Revenue”; and

(III) The remainder will be allocated to “Net Outpatient
Revenue.”

G. The trend indices listed below will be applied to the
apportioned inpatient adjusted net revenue and outpatient adjusted
net revenue in order to inflate or trend forward the adjusted net rev-
enues from the FRA fiscal year cost report to the current state fiscal
year to determine the inpatient and outpatient adjusted net revenues
subject to the FRA assessment.

(I) SFY 2009 = 5.50%
(II) SFY 2009 Missouri Specific Trend = 1.50%
(III) SFY 2010 = 3.90%
(IV) SFY 2010 Missouri Specific Trend = 1.50%
(V) SFY 2011 = 3.20%

Page 1174 Proposed Rules
August 1, 2012
Vol. 37, No. 15



(VI) SFY 2012 = 5.33% 
(VII) SFY 2013 = 4.4%

14. Net operating revenue—Gross charges less bad debts, less
charity care, and less contractual allowances times the trend indices
listed in 13 CSR 70-15.010(3)(B).

15. Other operating revenues—The other operating revenue is
total other revenue less government appropriations, less donations,
and less income from investments times the trend indices listed in 13
CSR 70-15.010(3)(B).

AUTHORITY: sections 208.201 and 208.453, RSMo Supp. [2010]
2011, and section 208.455, RSMo 2000. Emergency rule filed Sept.
21, 1992, effective Oct. 1, 1992, expired Jan. 28, 1993. Emergency
rule filed Jan. 15, 1993, effective Jan. 25, 1993, expired May 24,
1993. Original rule filed Sept. 21, 1992, effective June 7, 1993. For
intervening history, please consult the Code of State Regulations.
Emergency amendment filed June 20, 2012, effective July 1, 2012,
expires Dec. 28, 2012. Amended: Filed July 2, 2012. 

PUBLIC COST: This proposed amendment will not cost state agen-
cies or political subdivisions more than five hundred dollars ($500)
in SFY 2013.

PRIVATE COST: The FRA will raise approximately $1.063 billion for
SFY 2013 (July 1, 2012–June 30, 2013), of which $44.8 million is
attributable to the trend factor that is the subject of this proposed
amendment.  

NOTICE TO SUBMIT COMMENTS:  Anyone may file a statement in
support of or in opposition to this proposed amendment with the
Department of Social Services, MO HealthNet Division,
615 Howerton Court, Jefferson City, MO 65109. To be considered,
comments must be delivered by regular mail, express or overnight
mail, in person, or by courier within thirty (30) days after publica-
tion of this notice in the Missouri Register. If to be hand-delivered,
comments must be brought to the MO HealthNet Division at
615 Howerton Court, Jefferson City, Missouri.  No public hearing is
scheduled.

Page 1175
August 1, 2012
Vol. 37, No. 15 Missouri Register



August 1, 2012
Vol. 37, No. 15Page 1176 Proposed Rules



Page 1177
August 1, 2012
Vol. 37, No. 15 Missouri Register



Title 13—DEPARTMENT OF SOCIAL SERVICES 
Division 70—MO HealthNet Division 

Chapter 15—Hospital Program

PROPOSED AMENDMENT

13 CSR 70-15.160 Prospective Outpatient Hospital Services
Reimbursement Methodology. The division is amending section
(1).

PURPOSE: This amendment provides for a change to increase the
prospective outpatient rate for federally-designated critical access
hospitals and state-designated critical access hospitals for dates of
service July 1, 2012, through June 30, 2013.

(1) Prospective Outpatient Hospital Services Reimbursement
Percentage for Hospitals Located Within Missouri.

(C) Outpatient Hospital Services Reimbursement Limited by
Rule. 

1. Effective for dates of service September 1, 1985, and annu-
ally updated, certain clinical diagnostic laboratory procedures will be
reimbursed from a Medicaid fee schedule which shall not exceed a
national fee limitation.

2. Effective for service dates beginning October 1, 2011, and
annually updated, the technical component of outpatient radiology
procedures will be reimbursed from a Medicaid fee schedule.
Medicaid fee schedule amounts will be based on one hundred twen-
ty-five percent (125%) of the Medicare Physician fee schedule rate
using Missouri Locality 01. The list of affected procedure codes and
the Medicaid fee schedule rate for the technical component of out-
patient radiology procedures will be published on the MO HealthNet
website at www.dss.mo.gov/mhd beginning October 1, 2011.  

3. Effective for service dates October 1, 2011, through June 30,
2012, hospitals which meet the federal definition of Critical Access
Hospital (CAH) found in section 1820(c)(2)(B) of the Social Security
Act will receive a five percent (5%) increase to their prospective out-
patient payment percentage rate determined in accordance with sub-
section (1)(A).

4. Effective for service dates July 1, 2012, through June 30,
2013, hospitals which meet the federal definition of Critical
Access Hospital (CAH) found in section 1820(c)(2)(B) of the
Social Security Act will receive a five percent (5%) increase to
their prospective outpatient payment percentage rate determined
in accordance with subsection (1)(A).

5. Effective for service dates July 1, 2012, through June 30,
2013, hospitals which meet the state definition of Critical Access
Hospital (CAH) defined in 13 CSR 70-15.010 will receive a three
percent (3%) increase to their prospective outpatient payment
percentage rate determined in accordance with subsection (1)(A).

[4.]6. Services of hospital-based physicians and certified regis-
tered nurse anesthetists shall be billed on a CMS-1500 professional
claim form and reimbursed from a Medicaid fee schedule or the
billed charge, if less. The CMS-1500 professional claim form is
incorporated by reference and made a part of this rule as published
by the Department of Social Services, MO HealthNet Division, 615
Howerton Court, Jefferson City, MO 65109, at its website at
www.dss.mo.gov/mhd, November 1, 2010. This rule does not incor-
porate any subsequent amendments or additions.

[5.]7. Outpatient hospital services provided for those recipients
having available Medicare benefits shall be reimbursed by Medicaid
to the extent of the deductible and coinsurance as imposed under
Title XVIII.

[6.]8. Effective for payment dates beginning October 1, 2010,
reimbursement of Medicare/Medicaid crossover claims (crossover
claims) for Medicare Part B and Medicare Advantage/Part C outpa-
tient hospital services with dates of service on or after January 1,
2010, except for public hospitals operated by the Department of
Mental Health (DMH), shall be determined as follows:

A. Crossover claims for Medicare Part B outpatient hospital
services in which Medicare was the primary payer and the MO
HealthNet Division (MHD) is the payer of last resort for cost-shar-
ing (i.e., coinsurance, copay, and/or deductibles) must meet the fol-
lowing criteria to be eligible for MHD reimbursement:  

(I) The crossover claim must be related to Medicare Part B
outpatient hospital services that were provided to MO HealthNet par-
ticipants also having Medicare Part B coverage; and 

(II) The crossover claim must contain approved outpatient
hospital services which MHD is billed for cost-sharing; and

(III) The Other Payer paid amount field on the claim must
contain the actual amount paid by Medicare. The MO HealthNet
provider is responsible for accurate and valid reporting of crossover
claims submitted to MHD for payment regardless of how the claim
is submitted. Providers submitting crossover claims for Medicare
Part B outpatient hospital services to MHD must be able to provide
documentation that supports the information on the claim upon
request. The documentation must match the information on the
Medicare Part B plan’s remittance advice. Any amounts paid by
MHD that are determined to be based on inaccurate data will be sub-
ject to recoupment; 

B. Crossover claims for Medicare Advantage/Part C
(Medicare Advantage) outpatient hospital services in which a
Medicare Advantage plan was the primary payer and MHD is the
payer of last resort for cost-sharing (i.e., coinsurance, copay, and/or
deductibles) must meet the following criteria to be eligible for MHD
reimbursement:  

(I) The crossover claim must be related to Medicare
Advantage outpatient hospital services that were provided to MO
HealthNet participants who also are either a Qualified Medicare
Beneficiary (QMB Only) or Qualified Medicare Beneficiary Plus
(QMB Plus); and 

(II) The crossover claim must be submitted as a Medicare
UB-04 Part C Professional Crossover claim through the MHD online
[Internet] billing system; and

(III) The crossover claim must contain approved outpatient
hospital services which MHD is billed for cost-sharing; and

(IV) The Other Payer paid amount field on the claim must
contain the actual amount paid by the Medicare Advantage plan. The
MO HealthNet provider is responsible for accurate and valid report-
ing of crossover claims submitted to MHD for payment. Providers
submitting crossover claims for Medicare Advantage outpatient hos-
pital services to MHD must be able to provide documentation that
supports the information on the claim upon request. The documen-
tation must match the information on the Medicare Advantage plan’s
remittance advice. Any amounts paid by MHD that are determined
to be based on inaccurate data will be subject to recoupment;

C. MHD reimbursement for approved outpatient hospital ser-
vices. MHD will reimburse seventy-five percent (75%) of the allow-
able cost-sharing amount; and

D. MHD will continue to reimburse one hundred percent
(100%) of the allowable cost-sharing amounts for outpatient services
provided by public hospitals operated by DMH as set forth above in
paragraph (1)(C)4.

AUTHORITY: sections 208.152, 208.153, and 208.201, RSMo Supp.
2011. Emergency rule filed June 20, 2002, effective July 1, 2002,
expired Feb. 27, 2003. Original rule filed June 14, 2002, effective
Jan. 30, 2003. For intervening history, please consult the Code of
State Regulations. Emergency amendment filed June 20, 2012, effec-
tive July 1, 2012, expires Dec. 28, 2012. Amended: Filed June 20,
2012.

PUBLIC COST: This proposed amendment will cost state agencies or
political subdivisions $13.4 million annually.

PRIVATE COST: This proposed amendment will not cost private enti-
ties more than five hundred dollars ($500) in the aggregate for SFY
2013.

Page 1178 Proposed Rules
August 1, 2012
Vol. 37, No. 15



NOTICE TO SUBMIT COMMENTS: Anyone may file a statement in
support of or in opposition to this proposed amendment with the
Department of Social Services, MO HealthNet Division,
615 Howerton Court, Jefferson City, MO 65109. To be considered,
comments must be delivered by regular mail, express or overnight
mail, in person, or by courier within thirty (30) days after publica-
tion of this notice in the Missouri Register. If to be hand-delivered,
comments must be brought to the MO HealthNet Division at
615 Howerton Court, Jefferson City, Missouri.  No public hearing is
scheduled.

Page 1179
August 1, 2012
Vol. 37, No. 15 Missouri Register



August 1, 2012
Vol. 37, No. 15Page 1180 Proposed Rules



Title 16—RETIREMENT SYSTEMS
Division 10—The Public School Retirement System of

Missouri
Chapter 4—Membership and Creditable Service

PROPOSED AMENDMENT

16 CSR 10-4.012 Payment for Reinstatement and Credit
Purchases. The Retirement System is amending section (9).

PURPOSE: This amendment deletes from the existing rule the option
to complete payment for a purchase of Public Education Employee
Retirement System credit after disability retirement.

(9) If a member dies before retirement or retires on service or dis-
ability retirement after having made partial payments but not pay-
ment in full to reinstate or purchase credit, the partial payments will
be refunded to the member’s beneficiary or the retiree if proportion-
al credit is not allowable by law or by rule of the board of trustees.
If proportional credit is allowable, the payments will be credited to
the member’s accumulated contributions and proportional credit will
be allowed. If a member retires on disability retirement before com-
pleting payment for a reinstatement of credit [or for a purchase of
Public Education Employee Retirement System of Missouri
(PEERS) credit] only, the balance due with interest shall be deduct-
ed from the disability retirement allowance as provided by law. Only
payments purchasing less than first one-one-hundred thousandth
(0.00001) year of credit will be refunded.

AUTHORITY: section 169.020, RSMo Supp. [2010] 2011. Original
rule filed June 23, 1998, effective Jan. 30, 1999. For intervening his-
tory, please consult the Code of State Regulations. Amended: Filed
July 2, 2012.

PUBLIC COST: This proposed amendment will not cost state agen-
cies or political subdivisions more than five hundred dollars ($500)
in the aggregate.

PRIVATE COST: This proposed amendment will not cost private enti-
ties more than five hundred dollars ($500) in the aggregate.

NOTICE TO SUBMIT COMMENTS: Anyone may file a statement in
support of or in opposition to this proposed amendment with the
Public School and Education Employee Retirement Systems of
Missouri, Attn: M. Steve Yoakum, PO Box 268, Jefferson City, MO
65102-0268. To be considered, comments must be received within
thirty (30) days after publication of this notice in the Missouri
Register. No public hearing is scheduled.

Title 16—RETIREMENT SYSTEMS
Division 10—The Public School Retirement System of

Missouri
Chapter 5—Retirement, Options and Benefits

PROPOSED AMENDMENT

16 CSR 10-5.010 Service Retirement. The Retirement System is
amending section (15) and adding a new section to be numbered sec-
tion (18).

PURPOSE: This amendment clarifies and expands on the existing
rule that sets forth the procedure for naming successor beneficiaries
and clarifies the effective date of a retirement allowance increase due
to a member following the death of a joint and survivor beneficiary.

(15) [The effective date of] Any actuarial adjustment to a retire-
ment allowance payment made because of the nomination of a suc-
cessor beneficiary as provided in [House Bill 496 enacted by the
87th General Assembly] 169.141, RSMo, shall [be the next
regular payment date following receipt in the retirement
office of the] take effect in the month a properly completed nom-
ination of successor beneficiary form is received by the Retirement
System or the month of the retiree’s marriage to the successor
beneficiary, whichever occurs later. The nomination of a succes-
sor beneficiary shall be effective immediately upon receipt by the
Retirement System of the properly completed nomination of suc-
cessor beneficiary form or the date of the retiree’s marriage to
the successor beneficiary, whichever occurs later.

(18) If the designated joint and survivor beneficiary of a retiree
who elected Option 2, 3, or 4 dies before the retired member, the
retired member’s retirement allowance will be increased to the
amount the retired member would be receiving had the retired
member elected Option 1. The increase in retirement allowance
shall be effective the month of the beneficiary’s death. 

AUTHORITY: section 169.020, RSMo Supp. [2010] 2011. Original
rule filed Dec. 19, 1975, effective Jan. 1, 1976. For intervening his-
tory, please consult the Code of State Regulations. Amended: Filed
July 2, 2012.

PUBLIC COST: This proposed amendment will not cost state agen-
cies or political subdivisions more than five hundred dollars ($500)
in the aggregate.

PRIVATE COST: This proposed amendment will not cost private enti-
ties more than five hundred dollars ($500) in the aggregate.

NOTICE TO SUBMIT COMMENTS: Anyone may file a statement in
support of or in opposition to this proposed amendment with the
Public School and Education Employee Retirement Systems of
Missouri, Attn: M. Steve Yoakum, PO Box 268, Jefferson City, MO
65102-0268. To be considered, comments must be received within
thirty (30) days after publication of this notice in the Missouri
Register. No public hearing is scheduled.

Title 16—RETIREMENT SYSTEMS
Division 10—The Public School Retirement System of

Missouri
Chapter 6—The Public Education Employee Retirement

System of Missouri

PROPOSED AMENDMENT

16 CSR 10-6.045 Payment for Reinstatement and Credit
Purchases. The Retirement System is amending the title of the rule
and section (7).

PURPOSE: This amendment deletes from the existing rule the option
to complete payment for a purchase of Public School Retirement
System credit after disability retirement.

(7) If a member dies before retirement or retires on service or dis-
ability retirement after having made partial payments but not pay-
ment in full to reinstate or purchase credit, the partial payments will
be refunded to the member’s beneficiary or the retiree if proportion-
al credit is not allowable by law or by rule of the board of trustees.
If proportional credit is allowable, the payments will be credited to
the member’s accumulated contributions and proportional credit will
be allowed. If a member retires on disability retirement before com-
pleting payment for a reinstatement of credit [or for a purchase of
Public School Retirement System of Missouri (PSRS) credit]

Page 1181
August 1, 2012
Vol. 37, No. 15 Missouri Register



only, the balance due with interest shall be deducted from the dis-
ability retirement allowance as provided by law. Only payments pur-
chasing less than first one-one-hundred thousandth (0.00001)
year of credit will be refunded.

AUTHORITY: section 169.610, RSMo Supp. [2010] 2011. Original
rule filed June 15, 1994, effective Nov. 30, 1994. For intervening his-
tory, please consult the Code of State Regulations. Amended: Filed
July 2, 2012. 

PUBLIC COST: This proposed amendment will not cost state agen-
cies or political subdivisions more than five hundred dollars ($500)
in the aggregate.

PRIVATE COST: This proposed amendment will not cost private enti-
ties more than five hundred dollars ($500) in the aggregate.

NOTICE TO SUBMIT COMMENTS: Anyone may file a statement in
support of or in opposition to this proposed amendment with the
Public School and Education Employee Retirement Systems of
Missouri, Attn: M. Steve Yoakum, PO Box 268, Jefferson City, MO
65102-0268. To be considered, comments must be received within
thirty (30) days after publication of this notice in the Missouri
Register. No public hearing is scheduled.

Title 16—RETIREMENT SYSTEMS
Division 10—The Public School Retirement System of

Missouri
Chapter 6—The Public Education Employee Retirement

System of Missouri

PROPOSED AMENDMENT

16 CSR 10-6.060 Service Retirement. The Retirement System is
amending section (8) and adding a new section to be numbered sec-
tion (14).

PURPOSE: This amendment clarifies and expands on the existing
rule that sets forth the procedure for naming successor beneficiaries
and clarifies the effective date of a retirement allowance increase due
to a member following the death of a joint and survivor beneficiary.

(8) [The effective date of] Any actuarial adjustment to a retire-
ment allowance payment made because of the nomination of a suc-
cessor beneficiary as provided in [House Bill 496 enacted by the
87th General Assembly] 169.715, RSMo, shall [be the next
regular payment date following receipt in the retirement
office of the] take effect in the month a properly completed nom-
ination of successor beneficiary form [(see 16 CSR 10-5.010)] is
received by the Retirement System or the month of the retiree’s
marriage to the successor beneficiary, whichever occurs later.
The nomination of a successor beneficiary shall be effective
immediately upon receipt by the Retirement System of the prop-
erly completed nomination of successor beneficiary form or the
date of the retiree’s marriage to the successor beneficiary,
whichever occurs later.

(14) If the designated joint and survivor beneficiary of a retiree
who elected Option 2, 3, or 4 dies before the retired member, the
retired member’s retirement allowance will be increased to the
amount the retired member would be receiving had the retired
member elected Option 1. The increase in retirement allowance
shall be effective the month of the beneficiary’s death. 

AUTHORITY: section 169.610, RSMo Supp. [2009] 2011. Original
rule filed Dec. 19, 1975, effective Jan. 1, 1976. For intervening his-

tory, please consult the Code of State Regulations. Amended: Filed
July 2, 2012.

PUBLIC COST: This proposed amendment will not cost state agen-
cies or political subdivisions more than five hundred dollars ($500)
in the aggregate.

PRIVATE COST: This proposed amendment will not cost private enti-
ties more than five hundred dollars ($500) in the aggregate.

NOTICE TO SUBMIT COMMENTS: Anyone may file a statement in
support of or in opposition to this proposed amendment with the
Public School and Education Employee Retirement Systems of
Missouri, Attn: M. Steve Yoakum, PO Box 268, Jefferson City, MO
65102-0268. To be considered, comments must be received within
thirty (30) days after publication of this notice in the Missouri
Register. No public hearing is scheduled.

Title 20—DEPARTMENT OF INSURANCE, 
FINANCIAL INSTITUTIONS AND PROFESSIONAL

REGISTRATION
Division 2205—Missouri Board of Occupational 

Therapy
Chapter 1—General Rules

PROPOSED AMENDMENT

20 CSR 2205-1.050 Fees. The board is proposing to amend subsec-
tions (1)(D) and (1)(E).

PURPOSE: The Board of Occupational Therapy is statutorily oblig-
ated to enforce and administer the provisions of sections 324.050 to
324.089, RSMo. Pursuant to sections 324.065 and 324.074, RSMo,
the board shall by rule and regulation set the amount of fees autho-
rized by sections 324.050 to 324.089, RSMo, so that the revenue pro-
duced is sufficient, but not excessive, to cover the cost and expense
to the committee for administering the provisions. Therefore, the
committee is proposing a one- (1-) time reduction of the biennial
renewal fees.

(1) The Division of Professional Registration establishes the follow-
ing fees which are nonrefundable:

(D) Biennial Occupational Therapist License 
Renewal Fee $55.00

1. Effective July 1, 2013, to June 30, 2015, for 
the 2013 renewal period $30.00

2. Effective July 1, 2015, beginning with the 
2015 renewal period $55.00

(E) Biennial Occupational Therapy Assistant License 
Renewal Fee $30.00

1. Effective July 1, 2013, to June 30, 2015, for
the 2013 renewal period $25.00

2. Effective July 1, 2015, beginning with the 
2015 renewal period $30.00

AUTHORITY: section[s 324.065, 324.068, and] 324.074, RSMo
2000, and sections 324.065 and 324.068, RSMo Supp. 2011. This
rule originally filed as 4 CSR 205-1.050. Original rule filed Aug. 4,
1998, effective Dec. 30, 1998. For intervening history, please consult
the Code of State Regulations. Amended: Filed June 25, 2012.

PUBLIC COST: This proposed amendment will cost state agencies
approximately fifty-six thousand dollars ($56,000) in the aggregate.
It is anticipated that the costs will recur for the life of the rule, may
vary with inflation, and are expected to increase at the rate project-
ed by the Legislative Oversight Committee.

Page 1182 Proposed Rules
August 1, 2012
Vol. 37, No. 15



PRIVATE COST: This proposed amendment will save private entities
approximately fifty-six thousand dollars ($56,000) in the aggregate.
It is anticipated that the costs will recur for the life of the rule, may
vary with inflation, and are expected to increase at the rate project-
ed by the Legislative Oversight Committee.

NOTICE TO SUBMIT COMMENTS: Anyone may file a statement in
support of or in opposition to this proposed amendment with the
Board of Occupational Therapy, PO Box 1335, Jefferson City, MO
65102, by facsimile at (573) 526-3489, or via email at ot@pr.mo.gov.
To be considered, comments must be received within thirty (30) days
after publication of this notice in the Missouri Register. No public
hearing is scheduled.

Page 1183
August 1, 2012
Vol. 37, No. 15 Missouri Register



August 1, 2012
Vol. 37, No. 15Page 1184 Proposed Rules



Page 1185
August 1, 2012
Vol. 37, No. 15 Missouri Register


	Table of Contents
	Emergency Rules
	Executive Orders
	Proposed Rules
	Agriculture
	Conservation
	Social Services
	Retirement Systems
	Insurance, Financial Institutions and Professional Registration

	Orders of Rulemaking
	In Additions
	Contractor Debarment List
	Dissolutions
	Source Guides
	Rule Changes Since Update
	Emergency Rules in Effect
	Executive Orders
	Register Index


	p: 
	o: 


